TR &, §.ue.- 33004/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of India

.30, -3).T.-37.-03062026-27 3089
CG-DL -E-03062026-273089

AT
EXTRAORDINARY

T HHI—9Us 4
PART III—Section 4

grfee ¥ TFfaT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

. 370] T8 aeeht, HoreraTe, S 2, 2026/59%5 12, 1948
No. 370] NEW DELHI, TUESDAY, JUNE 2, 2026/JYAISHTHA 12, 1948
I g i< g = srerar A

< faeett, 1 574, 2026
WA FRETAT ST ST ATHAT SIS (THTI TihAT) (I wervew) f@FfHaw, 2026

B G, s 1. H.3mE./2026-27/S. U /AT 251151 —ared 1T fRarer sfiT oty sterHar 4%,

@ sfiT o sterwar Sf24ar, 2016 (2016 F7 31) it €T 240 F AT IT5T &7 196 FT ITLTT (1) F
TT () T Y& ARRAT FT TN FId U, ATLAT [QATAT 3T e STeqwar are (A giear) o,
2016 T 3T AT FA o Q. Aeterteg fafe=s a=mar g, o2 -

1. (1) == =t 1 gferg arg g Qa7 ovee temar 9 (FHTa TiRaT) (ST Herrer)
fafe=m, 2026 7 1

(2) T TISTIS § 3ok THTLA T JTLE T TG i |

2. AT TRATAT 3T e 7eq9ar A€ (A 9ohan) A, 2016 (S =98 389+ 741 g
faffa e war 8) & At 2 % s-faffew (1) 4,

(i) @< (T@F) % == 92 i @ T@r S, a9iq-
3955 G1/2026 (1)



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC.4]

TAT:-

“(TF) “FIETA” & 9T 21 3 T ST AT il AHIS AT 57
(i) == (1) H,

(F) ITEE (v) FT & =T ST |

(@) ITEE (vii) FT AT AT ST |
wer fateaet @, [t 2% % s o7 fAeterferd fafeae T s, sreiqg-
“2F. GUTYH AT § {LraT_

gfearas gfafa F geet q, Fare =i f 39F g wgfoa 9 anfeaat 7 fds qHm
AR  rterrr § Ut OfF # ofiw UF et o7 oat F o= gy gu, s afmfy g sEfea
#Y ST, FITETT FTA T AUAT FL THT |7

o fafaawt & [ 29 °, T g & TEq, Mt awegs siaeariea R s,

‘O T ST T TRAHTIS gIRT AT sfert=am, 2013 Fit gy 230 F 7 FIs GHATT AT 35409
T T FIEA Tl AT STTUAT, S T
(F) UET FHATAT AT ST FUT A=, 2013 F¥ &7 230 FT ITLTT (6) H TAT-IT= f2ra
AR % AT TgHT T STAAITST 7 [T AT 2T; 37
(T TETiaT AHEATT AT SZE 6 AT AFGT il agAA 7 Thd, fZamer g g it aia
T AT FHTIH oF F Igax T ar I”
T fafaeat , faffew 3 & v, Meferiaa St sia et frar s, soai-
“3%. ARt giAfa gIRT aREATTE i frerfer |

(1) |tefa, SEaT it 92T 34 T STLTT (1) o TIISAT & (70, FATIT 6 T Sraer aid 37 9 94,
afEATTE F =7 § AgRe F o, a1 g =9 g9y #§ 73R fhu 1u fRarer sSmaarta & o9d §
T ey wa fRareT saraaTtaE & A Y fRrerter

(2) ST-fafe=m (1) % s1efie Rrarier At & Taar 397 F F7 9 77 A6 II90T & qd Fe7 00
STTOAAT |

(3) SU-FAf=H (2) = srefier fornrieer &t AT 9=, =AU TR qaHTT f =h wed
T v AT 9% A= w1

o fafaeat , A 4 % wam v, et G war s, sere-
“4. qfEHATTF f 9 |

(1) afafa, AT TRAT & I, TREHTTE S FRE & TETq Tgel S5% § T 34 H ITERT
(8) F ATATY e THIa FT Tl |




[T [[I—&7E 4]

HILT T TSIA . AHTYTL

3

(2) =tz wtafa 7 S9-fafa=e (1) % srefie e fFara 981 67 8 q1 T899+ o0t 9O srafer o forw, Faemnt
=1 faafa e % gfaaa ® =0 § Fie 3 e it

Ao ff v (Tt H) e w9 fi 1 e
TIH GE AT H IS B AT H SHF TET

Rt #r fFafa @ (T anm & Siewl)

TIH 1 FE T 5.00 4.00 2.0

A 9 TS T 4.00 3.00 1.50

T 40 FIE T 2.50 2.0 1.0

T 50 FUE T 1.25 1.0 0.50

g Y T Afaf=h et aw | 0.25 0.20 0.10

TOSRTOT — A wqF o srar g & =0 RAfRaw it svemd 9T fRamar i ore steawar are

(TR ST (3T eree) afaTw, 2026 % s g it AT &l 37 I8 TET T &I arett
FHTIT TTHATSAl T AR AT |

7. 9= fafaawt & fAffaw 5 4 -

8.

9.

(i) ST-Fafe=w (1) & s 9, Aefeted s9-RfHas war s, sreiq-
“(1) oIS —
(F) T R (Rare); &
(@) foraes & q@ sifaw foe
AT FHT 32 Ieg 24 fAfqzwt & srefie fAfafde Ofq § =ma@oirs st s geqa s 1
(ii) ST-FafF=m (2) ®, “fiT Frdg” 9reat &7 AT /a1 Srua |
(iii) ST-Fafe=w (3) ), “RTe i FrIgw” 9real & w1 u¥ “Rare” oreq T@T ST |
o fafaemt & AW 7 & su-fatew (1) 9, sreartas [y w7 96ar 27 a&&1 § T2 gt

& SATHIET & A&7 Aq:TATOd FohT STUAr |

o fafaasi 4, afaaw 8 % v w= fRwferfaa fafa=w war sromm, sraiq-
“8. ATl it TR |

(1) &T=T 21 % el ST ATl ot FIHTT THTIT TRAT o I 13 Hdl i

T UAT FlE Iaga o=are, e g 52 % stefiq o afaqia {a &1 afiamr 981 & 2,
AT T AT TET ST |

T AT AT T 9T 53 T 39U (1) & @ (|) § R 0 eqdiawor & g2 §, AT a9ar e
0T T ToF THAT ¢ T 34 ANTAT AFETE AT ST &, 0 % AT AN % forw afafa w1 9w
ST 3l¥ 36 91T 607 % JoF 6 (o0 AAGTT FHI HT ATIRT AT |

TSR 9T 53 T TR (1) F @ (@) H &0 10 Trdiawaor % y7qreEt & foro, sfagfa Ba &
T fafaaw 35 & SETe AaeTd a1 Tod g |




THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC.4]

(2) ATTAT TATAT T 9ITe STeAHaT a1 (FILAE ATHAT 6 (o7 feare T gara wiwarn) afaam,
2016 F e 7 % fafaaw 18 & fAfAaw 26 =i sream 9 F Iuay, q9TIA FrAaTar & 7efie
TqTT T TSHT T TATALTF TAAAT Aigd AR AT

e AT T IgeAT T3 THTIT I g b AT & 77 foe 3 fiqe gers Sirus |
(3) ¥ JoF ¥, TREHTIF FiAta F gwer Faferfaa yeqa Fam:
() ATETTAH THTIA AR, AT AT & SATeF g 6 FIUT qid, TS FIE 8;
(@) e fafeer wrdarteat & auteg fRufa; sie
(1) ST & g I |
(4) aFEATIF TS % @ AT & o7 Fefeed w1 agi
() fafa=w 7 % st s smEarEt it A sie arfeatie,
(@) afEHTTE it
(3T) FTHTIT AT,
(=) fafa=w 35 & Su-fAf==w (2) & stefi= geais,
(F) FLARE (T FRT AT 39% Tawg el aral a1 fafas Frdareat 1 S w@er av
TTRAT FTAT;
(F) FTGAT 1 5 0T 1 F G (12) § TAT-ITS AT FTR1AT [5G T TTAHA o6 Ha1T & 7o ot
T ¥ e, femdy Tifew ® v BT S
(B) a1 54 FT ITATRT (19) * 397 & aAnmT = foaqwor & dag & Greft arg a7 wdarteat
T AN e o T =g =aeT;

(37) ST-Fafe=w (5) § TEaE ATH T hAThaATT & Har, FAIT TRaT 8§ 9aiad His
=T AqTHT AT FRaTwery, Star afata g ARt e s
(5) eI, 7 ¥ w9 fams gfaad qaa ser g 9T T F 99 sqHed & o,
Rerferera & gaferd At § Fis f1d dgi H:
() FafRerr 32 % srefi= oy, rerer siaeta foser & f9, Sermi-aa srgard, smefera i,
o Tore i ey strar off €
(@) @ G, Fed Fare &t & fGaed & garq AfeH=T eragrl, =F-geaithd
HHAAGY, ITTH TIT FAAGT AT FIYUl 3T AT ATI il d1ad FAATG! %0l SITUIT
T 9g At e == FrEar=al ¥ YT AnEt ®, Iie Fw §, Fata B s |
(1) THT FEE-TRT ATETAT AT, ST A TLA-T T TGl &, TATSAHE |
(6) TfAfT i 37 T ft T AfHErET T ATHFRE T g R, S AFET FIT rutera gt |
(7) FIE TRETaT AT ST & S0 Ash ITiega stafate, aamas IhHRaT § U8 J9er &
TTTAFd TTA TS o &7 | T FLaT LT S AT (QaTaT 3T o7e STeqaar 9 (FETe A hal
F foro fearar auram whwn) AfFag, 2016 F BfFaw 165 F su-fafFaw (3%) & (12) F Uy
TATAAF TAAHT Aigd AR Zi |




[ATT [II—@TE 4] ST 3T TSI ; STETETLOT 5

8. SIRAAT F FEATa<or St T |

(1) STgT FRANE T Teh THT FHRANE TATHIAITAT § ST THIIH TRIT F oY @1 8, agi uH
FGIE O T TREATTF, Sa FTe AT & 8, T3 FTReE 0 o GHTeTT SATaa TS
T o Ut s & T 8, UE wrede Fwoft £, S v sargfa & 7€ 8, wrdne fRarer
THTETT TFAT § TR F ZEAiaor o ael § T e |

(2) 9TeT 28A F TATSAT  forw, aiEHTT U wrede it fit afffa 7, S 08 Fedne &=t

i, o Ut e & S 8, FRAE RErer qHTen ST # orfEd & gEaiaeer & o s
TATH & 8, SATHIET ITH HT |

(3) ST FUe (T it AT FRT FEATALI T AT &0 gU FANE TATHAETAT % &9 |
AIHIE (@A STAT g q27 UH HRAIE Uil FHT TRIATIE Tg AT AT 4 Teqrad geaiado
T T Rie Si srfed ST § S~ &9 8 The fhar S |

89. TREHATIF T Tfaemu |

qtafa, 79 7 F7 =AmEs Iiaerd adqi g TREHTTH F IAeITod FEd o7 T8 H7 Gahdl g 8T
TEATAT TREHTTS ol U T H, ST &l g1 AT =ra a1 ST, ferferd a8t ST 7 & TETq
TREHTT F giaeemy % fore = faorass TraeT<T 3 JHeT UF Araa" wed 4 |

T STal TREHTTE TaeTiid AT ST SEatiad 2l agf ag ad a& 3 Fdl TgiT Sd aF 6
TREHTTS T eI T8 2l ST |

10. g1 A=At & fafaaw 9 & su-fafF=w (1) F @< (F) #, “Fare Tl &1 g9aqs a7 AR M5l &
TATE “AT 41T 34 Fit 39T (3) H AT Frg 77 =af~” orex sia:wamiua fohu Sroar |

11. g1 fataaat & fafaaw 10 % so-fafaaw (1) 9, “|fa=T  srqaeor § i w1 BT 8 a6 a8 @699 awy
B AT AT | WIE % & A1 UHT 9@rs T2 aie), S o =rrat=orees qaerrT sqafa &, 1 Hai a7
HaaT F7 TET e F O saes T a9ar 87 a1 & T 9% “Hi6ar & Aqaeer §, i ¥ AqHET 6
TOHT FTA o THT, THIA A S H Tod [ A7 UAT 37E T2 sratey, star & =araforirss qrdesr s
T, FATAAOTTIR YTTERTET o |y §9T AT HART T aTaT SIS o o7 ATad F¥ Tahdl g U8 TG ST |

12. g fafqgwi & fAffaw 12 9 -
(i) IT-FAT= (1) #, “SIgAT || F T57 @ #” a1 & T 0 “UH T8T H, 47 arS g7 A=
T STTU” 9re T@ STU |
(ii) IT-Fafe=e (2) =1 AT BT ST |
13. 7= fafaai & fAffaw 13 4,
(i) “=rfaoTT TR oTeal & T 9T “HiHfd” ere8 T@T STua |

(ii) “THTAL” 9151 F TATH UX “TE” 9158 TET S(TUAT |

14. o AT F BT 14 9, 9g awmet gt F awwst 70 &0 77 98 ofte Greea & a1
AT & AT ag, Tt atafa F e #ir atraford #3a gu us feega R afga, =mafaores stiesr #r
ofter forere ofie forae et UF siraeas et & o reat & e 97 “ag =0 999 § fwraee! ardid &
qHE T 37 af2 o8 79 7 F4 Emas gfaea gaemw o g oty Fraea & oo fRer s=f g arag
afafa & At v affafoa #2a gu vs g RO gt =S sfassT #1 #rdre &t &

ofter fareresr = form si Uy fareresr it araa saewss fAen & forw swaes T 9reg T STu |




6 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC.4]

15. g1 fata=et & fAffas 15 9 -

(i) So-fafa=w (1) 9, ‘9 grar AfAEE = § Rafried e s RO eat & TErq |t
F THET TET STUI” 9T s Eemiua fh S |

(i) ST-FA=H (2) #, @ (@) F T 9 AHed @< 7@ ST, -
“(@) FATIT H IR ITRTAT Fd gu U foawoft, o stavia Mefertad onfie § -
(i) =fafT & ot F Fr,
(ii) =P FT9,
(iii) Forer fqre(Pd),
(iv) fFRaemeat £ g1 F1 d3raw,
(v) Tt Bt SRy 7 T ST e o7 A % g e
(vi) FRaameent =T o 7 faaeT, s
(vii) fRaemeent # o 1o srfashia st T e
(iii) ST-FAfH=H (5) ®, (A & =IH T, Meferiead g2 Tar STus, .-

“TETT: T fRaTet ATHIAF 13 wEal, 2026 FHl THREATTF a9d7 § 1T 12 I, 2026 =i
TTEATTF % & H A1 FIAT g7 F AT g ql a8 (58 TH1E S e Joqa Ham:

g, | fQuTET % siavia o aTelt srafer R yega F F sifqw arde
1 13 FaY - 31 714, 2026 15 o191. 2026
2 T — 12 A, 2026 27 3, 2026
g AT ITCHAT 3T AT o6 HO AT A (78 TR TEId HT:
qodferg | a9 % siaeid S ATt sty TET A &l Sfaw e
G .
1 13 FTaeT - 31 AT, 2026 15 19, 2026
2 e — 12 9, 2026 27 3, 2026"

16. T« faf=st & faffaw 16 4,

(i) T-Fafa=w (1) , “arEstes IRV § Iedted faw are w1 37 399 99 J949T 3147 5
FAT AT FARE RATAT THTLTT THRAT o IO T /0 T S99 219 &l ST=2aa= H, s
HAIT =T, e TS 8, AT ATHHS €7 orsal F TATH U¥ HHTIT YW g9 Hi arg F A1ag & &
AT AIAT ITAT TEIT BT ST (REATAT T I Al ATE &l FILANE [GATAT THTETT TTH6AT 6
FI T gl AT g 9168 T ST |

(i) Su-faff=w (2) #, “TuTIT YT FI T T R I ST AT <47 F fory, e stanta s,

Tz #1E 8, Y 87 =3t & w19 97 “faaret e g T aTE FT 90 TEq U Tw Tt o o erss
T STUA|




[ATT [II—@TE 4] ST 3T TSI ; STETETLOT 7

(iii) ST-Fafa=w (2) F wanq, Fefated S—EfRas sia:eatea fra s, seiq-
“(3) T RagTF SIH & IHHT AT RETAT T B 60 ATE o TET Rl o #d &
et ot T & T =7 qoia: I 87 SITaT &, 3T &Te 3l STrde i |”
17. g fafast & @R 17 % 3o-ffa=w (1) 7 ‘ST =3 1136 50 T H#” &1 & €019 97 “UH T69 | S0
e T ATIg =T AT ST 9re8 T S0 |
18. g=1 fafa=mt & fafa=w 18 % su-faff=m (1) #, “sr g =T | % =7 o |7 9real o T 9¢ U8 I%7 § S
e T AfIg=a AT ST ereg T A0 |
19. g=1 fafa==t & fafa=w 19 #: -
(i) ST-Fafe=m (1) &, “or g =T || & =T & §” 9a1 & €19 ¥ “UH &7 § S a1 g7 Afeg=a
T ST 9teg T@ STUAT |
(ii) ST-FafF=w (2) ®, “org=T || & T8 T §” 97eq1 o €| 9T “UH T=q § S IS T A =a
T ST 9teg T@ STUAT |
20. 71 fafaaat & fafa=w 20 & I9-faf=as (1) #, “Sqg= 1 1l F T8 & §” 511 & S 9 “TH T59 H {7
e FIRT AT =T AT ST 9168 TG ST |
21. 91 fafqzEt & e 21% #-
(i) I ofT &, “STLTIO” 958 o TATH I “THANT” 91 T@T S0
(ii) 3T-fafa=w (1) ¥,
(F) “TTAT AT QTR & TAT “Alag [adi 6 HiaL” es siq:eraa oy ST |
(@) “TTEAT || F T=T T AT T F §” 9T&a1 o A9 I “UF T&=T & 57 9IS g7 sAvergf=a fFam
ST0” 9Teg ¥ STTUAT |
(iii) ST-Faf= = (1) % T 4,
(F) ‘oo o ereal & T UY “Hiag faa” o T ST |

(@) “ATTEAAT F qTE H g STLTIUIT ! SATUIT o I FHTIT TIT” 9751 o TT9 U< “ArTeadl 7 FH19=
HOeT | AT qHSAT ST 9e8 T ST

(3T) “oT AT " eTeaT T AT AT STTUT |
(iv) 39-fafee (2) #,

(F) @< (F) |, “Tod” &Te7 o TATF X “YqATA1E” 9768 T@T ST |

(@) G (@) ¥, “UF G T eTeal o TITH I¥ “Fea” 957 T@T SATUT

22. g1 fafa=et & fAfFem 28 & su-faff=w (1) 9, 99199 YW g i I oeal % €19 9% faren
TTEH I %l AT’ 9768 TG S0 |

23. g1 fafa=HT & AAFH 30 & w9 0¥ Feforied [Has w@r S, [q9iq-

“30. ETET FT TATIA |



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC.4]

(1) afmaTa ffF=w 16 F su-faff=w (1) % s1efe s 3Ta 1 T 9=, S1aT 9T g o AT et
& AT AT T, TR, aTer T QU AT AT TR AT AEATHTL FE TR |

(2) TREATTE 3T AT FT AT, ST FRARE [RATAT THTETT THHAT % I ITH g0 F A Tohel FeaTad
Tel ThU T o, TREATIT YA g9 il e & &7d foA1 o FTae qeama T e e, &
T QT AT AT TR AT SEATRIL FHT HAT

T TREHTTE 39 T AT T: HeATaT Agl FT, SEawr aame srde GEmer qu9ram siwar
& I T a1l THT &

T Tg AT foF STgt afREmTaE T T FT AR FAT 8, 97 ag UHT AEATR % R Al
ot =7 9 srfsrferfaa w3 |

(3) TR FTET it TRFT AT AR daeft oA i, o afga, Baement i uHT =i
T SAEA I 6 AT Tl o Hrae Fg=rd Hw 1

24, g fafa==T & A=A 31 % Iu-fafqaw (2) 9, “Garetie” ae3 & S 9 ‘T 1 T@T ST |
25. 91 fat=aat & fafa=s 315 = faar sroa
26. =1 A=l & A= 32 & g & a7g, Mefefad STEor siq:eaaa a1 ST, T9iq; -

“TTSTRIOT: I8 *q fohar Srar g o afesmaes Gt ot wuamae s S |t ar afewrEredE
TS U Toheal TeaTs AT TTAT 7 UH TRET 1<k &1 faera A8l He, ST e 295 & oTefiT
THTLTT 3TaaH g & (o0 a8 17

27. 9 fat=Et & fafe=s 329 #1 @ fawar ST |
28. g1 fafe==t & fafa=w 33 #:

(i) Su-fafa=w (1) #, Fefafed e sia:eaaa T ST, srai-

“qeeq TREATTH 39 IU-fafaaw & stefiq =t arfeery &t 9@ =T & faar sfeadt v
o MarferfaT 1 981 Fam:

() &7 35 T ITETT (1) F G () F TLqF & T Td g, FANE 0T 6 Foheft
T TeThTe;

() I FETAT TLFRTL; AT
(1) I FRT Agh Fohelt ATEaTaT”
(ii) ST-Faf==w (2) F o 9, Mefatea se-REas w@r s, -

“(2) TREETTF FTETE Ol T TRTAt w1 yTgae o F Arenw ¥ e gfaad gaae
ster Afgd AfATT & I3 ST & THTq, a4t 1 7 ARt ad a g w2 a5, J9-

(F) e AT 2,

(T) AT F TeF | Agca 0l &9 F Frde At §91fead § IS SO Qd [aFT Tgl
[ERISISIEEHE]




[ATT [II—@TE 4] ST 3T TSI ; STETETLOT 9

(1) U fasra % forw =t STiEewrT it ST I Y o TS 8
e TREATTE ARG AT AT TrEde e gy Metied i qw

FT:
(F) FTCTNE 0T F TRt Fataa qerame;
() I TETAT TR AT
(1) 3T g7 FAeh oY samaetaes 1
29. = fafeert % fAffaw 34 7 -
(i) 3T-Fafarm (1) ®, “o=g<e” oreg & w419 9 “Yareii|” 9es T@T ST |
(i) 37-faffewT (2) ¥,

(F) @ (F) |, “HIRT H qod© oTeal | T2, “FAAaw 32 F arefiq” orsx sfaq:&iaa &g
ST |
(@) @< (@) FT AT AT ST |

(iii) IT-FafF=m (4) ®, "I e F TATH IT “WRIA” 975 TET S0

(iv) Iu-fafa=e (5) ®, “awmwel GiRta % T gaed” qeal & €79 9 g’ o8 T@r ST i
“HAETT ATEFTL TG aTed” 9Teal T AT AT [T |

30. 5=t fafe==t % fAfaer 35 #: -
(i) ST-Fafe=m (2) F o a7 Aeferiaa So-fafa=e @ ST, serq-

“(2) SU-faff=® (1) F siaviq T M a1 AT H AT ST&f GAfa & 98 T 2 & A
g fRafaaT o oTefid U qeaiae i aTHAT g agi TILHATTS THIIT TTEH g 6l arirg
% O faat & iy, ARFw 32 F o1efiT Feare ot it IEadt & agat TR o7 &

fRrgizor F7  forg a1 TS geaiwat il = 2

qveq Aot srfrat it TR geatss & =7 & s 7gt B s,
FAT: -

() THREATTF FT Fre oqam;
() FTLATLE FLOIT T e Garerd TEAHT;

(1) feaTaT YR F A G F TEad] T qUT 6 A AT ST q0T w0
SO T F1S or@T TEF; 4T

() UHT AT SATIETAE HEAT FT e AR 7 e e aiawmTs
arfteTe a7 Aeers 2

(i) 3T-FAr (3) #, "geurrfRata, swfEaa a7 FEaTe”, oreal F T U¥ “ATeadl” ereg TG ST |
(iii) IT-FAfH=w (4)  “A7 FLAT 9r&aT T AT /AT ST |
(iv) ST-Fafa=w (5) # “IXTwel” 91e7 T A1 FoRaT ST |




10 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC.4]

(v) ST-Faff=w (6) & “aermet wfafy & Tava” oreal % T U¥ ""iH{a” oreg T@T STUATT |
(vi) 3u-Fafa=w (7) & “aqormel” oreg T AT FoRAT SITOAT |
31. 9= fafaawt & fafas 37 & su-fAfaew (2) #:-
(i) “THE” oI5 F TATH 9T “HIG” 9168 T@T SITUAT |
(ii) “TT” 918  TATT IT “Aag” 968 T@T SATUAT |
32. gt vzt & A= 37% & 3u-fafa=w (1) #:-
(i) “%F TR B 9USE1 o T U % 0 AHIGT & 9% T S0
(ii) "faT== 315 & AqA RAemeeht St Tl 9reat w1 qr g T ST |

(iii) ST-FAfF=w (1) & TS0 ¥, "sqfHied areadr St 8" oeal & THTq "ATe heaet 9 gf AT
Tl 9rea S eATiad o SITor |
33. 7t fafaai & fafaew 38 & su-fafa=w (1) , "aREwTTs" oes & T "W & AqHIET F THT]
X" oreg AT 3T ST |

34. gt A==t & AATH 40 F TS0 §, "HIET" 968 AT AT HIT S0 |
35. g1 I & AATH 41 F IU-AETH (3) 7, "= HOT=F TIEFE" eeat & #27 92 "qiHia” e
T@T ST |
36. g1 fafe==t & fafaaw 42 9 -
(i) Su-faffae (1) ¥, "si< sufeq A" orsat &1 9 T STrosT |
(ii) ST-FafF=m (2) ®, "Too faa" oreal & =M1 9% "Uag " 9res T AT |
37. q= fafawi & fAffaw 44 . -
(i) ST-FafF=m (1) ®, "UF aU" 9real & T 92 "UF 97 qeH [ G 9re8 T ST |
(i) Su-fafaam (2) ¥, "usF aU" 9reg o T 9T "UF AT T foT" orew T AU |
(iii) IT-faf=w (2) #, “ag” wsz & wATq ‘=u AT F o= afufa § s v g 1w a5
e o ST |
(iv) Su-fafaer (2) & are, Mwferra Todiaor streT soa -

“TTSTRTOT: Ag TOY FRAT SITaT g o aREETTes, qTae AT o et s SariAeat o Rega
T T FLAT LT, T T 1o ATAATAF ITIAFRTET T e & o sraes w {fReT 987 ¢
o= a1

(v) 3u-fafeaw (2) F eqdiaor |, “ATed i fRaTeT ST 9N STerHar A (FHTI TiHAT) (Ferrer)
T, 20197 T F T 9T “aTRATT ATt 3 oTre ST AT (qHTIA THAT) (AT Herver)
R, 2026” 92 T@T STEAT |




[|TT III—ETE 4] HTL T (ST ETLTI0T 11

38. gt e+t & fAfF=w 447 ),
(i) “FT TATg T AT F TATH I % ATHIET F” 058 T S0 |

(ii) “TeTHE o187 T AT AT ST |
39. 7= A==t % fafq=w 45 ¥, 39-fafaaw (2) 30w (3) & v wx et faf{aw @ stroa, sraiq-

“(2) TREHTTF, TH 9T H, S dls g1 Ategi=a BHan S sitaw RO i squre T\ %
AT FILAE U 6 Toed JT THTIT THAT 6 ava HId g ATA A0 TTIEHRT i SeEaT Tedd
FATN”

40. go fafa==t & fAfRaw 457 #:-
(i) Su-TafF=w (2) F @ (F) § “OXTHe 958 T AT fohaT STuT |
(ii) @< () § “HHTIT THHAT § =7 THATT AT AT 9T5a1 1 AT BT SITos |

(iii) ST-Fafa=w (2) = @e (7) § “grifyrs Rure, sfea sma= i “anfea o Rare, artis fRafa
e ersat T Ara AT SO

(iv) IT-fafe=w (5) =1 &9 foRaT StTosT |
41. g=1 FAaf==at % fafaaw 46 F Iu-AHaw (5), (7) T (79) ®, “TEI-7” 9158 & €4 9 “UH 59 §, ST
e FIT AT BT ST 9753 T ST |
42. 91 fafa=at & A 47 % s w2 Mefotea [ @ s, seri-

“A7. guT gHaT F forw seel -

Aerforfaa aroft, T899 T=w g it ariE F fRET FTaiee ol it FHTOT THRAT i Tg ATHT
ArEeT THI-HTAT Toqq FLAT § 1o 30 TRAT § ot Tia=as, 2013(2013 F1 18) FT ey 230 F

T FHATAT AT ST ATHA Gl &

TuTY THaT % o sreet gug-iar

| g/ FTA FT IO CIEED Terae

q AT

(=T #)

1 T 33 3f¥ 34 | THTIA T YEH 37T TREATTF it | ver #ft.31. 0=F

BRI
2 g7 33(1) (@) | AR SSEIT gfaamrs £ FIRE S | fep
(ii)/ fafRw 12 5 o & fiax

3 fafa=w 35(2) T qeaidant ol =grn TAHEL F 7R F H+7
fra<

4 EIEREE: JeTd fr Amfa fragei o | At F7RAF fH+7
<

5 T T FAT; TAH . F14 7T+ H+14
<




12

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY

[PART III—SEC.4]

BT 16/ gy | YOS Ba & @ ow e
52 s fafeem | AT
21%
6 &t 30 ST 16 Fafymaat a7y | A R AT 7 " | H421
S—— = i
7 fatr=w 30 TS T/ T F49 & FTAT THHTT AT AFAHRTL $+28
Rforarr 3 ame # T F % 7 7T F fiaw
8 e 31(2) Raemeeht 1 g=T w12 FIAT T0ET T I AT S | Freag
e & 30 fa & fiax
9 | ffREw15 T, T TR v e FeAr; | Tedt st R F11+15
EGRURITRERICY F12+15
10 | BfRFT 15 TREATTE F Tl 9T § WIq | TREATOS T @gd 6 15 | 7 g &l
T frgrs o % e AETE+15
11 | IfFEm 42(2) RagTEaRT &7 ANTHT F7 feawor R A AT 15T | agEt i
& HTaY G +15
12 | afFaw 44 FTLATLE (T T FHTIT 180 fa=t & fiaz F+180
13 | afF=aw 46 AITATHT ATATN 3T st | A== 45 % 39-
SARTHT T ToHA STHT AT fafa=w (3) F srefiw
ATeET Toqd e J IF
14 | AT 1, FAE. | TH1 FreAindl I Aqad @ ATAAT THH TET FeA
12 gfawer T2 F1 F forw F for smg=or i e
EEpICIE T 90 fae % <
[T.1.: =R ITfEreRT<y, Uer. | .21, TR YA g il ariig]

43. g1 fafa=at it oI qg=t | & @< 1 7:-

(i) ITEE (1) T AT AT JTUT |

(i) ITEE (1) |, “OXTHeY” 9757 AT AT AT STUAT |
(iii) ITEE (19) |, “Ff TATE Aol <ol A&l F €9 I ‘&7 =g 981 Fedl” 953 T AT |
(iv) STET (4) ¥, “Smferg fAa F7° &l & THAT, “HiHid & ATHET §,” 058 Fq:EI1ha 0

ST

(V) STEE (4) F TLGH HT AT AT SITUIT |

(vi) ITEE (1) ¥, “Sgl TRAATIH” a1 & TATq, “Tegamas afdera Aaee st afga aifd &
AHIEH |, 9168 S EATiod o ST |
(vii) STET (129) ¥, “qume’” 7 “TAF=w 31F & erefiq” ersat &1 9 T st |



[|TT III—ETE 4] HTL T (ST ETLTI0T 13

(viii) ITEE (127) #, “gwrgel afufa 7 qewey” et & v T e yihed gaare st i
AT F AqHIEA 958 T SATU|
(ix) STET (12) #, “afaamass, grwst afffa F ool 87 aeat F e a7 “afemrTs, Bamas
TTIeTd HAQT 3ieT Aigd AfHfd & ATHIET & 9068 T S0 |
(x) ITEE (13) H, “IRAATIF" 977 & TATq, “fEATes Taerd qaar sier afgd arHtd & AqHET
T oTeg A FATHOT 3T ST |
44, 9 TAAFHT AT AT | % @ 2 F 396 (3F) ¥, “Fafaae 33 F srefie qerwst afuta & qwrwst & v
9r&at o T 9 “TAT=a 33 F SquTad |7 97e% @ ST |

45. 9= TAfaTst |, s 11 7 e R s
i foer, srewer
[FAsTTa=-111/4/374T1./140/2026-27]

feroqur: et fRETa S onvere stermar e (FuTaer wiEaT) AR, 2016, 9 F TSI, STETAT,
AN 3, T 4, . 460, dEM@ 15 fREww, 2016 # Sfeg@=«AT €. ore.d1.&t.ee./2016-
17/500.0. /3,250,005, arE 15 feawas, 2016 g Trfera o 10 o iz 399 =iy genes
T fRaTeT % oTre Terqar ave (q9Ta= wiowar) (e gerree) fafa=m, 2026 grer & @,
ST STtere@=aT |, e, d1.81.35./2026-27/5.UA. /.2 51,142, i@ 19 7, 2026 T 9T &
TS, ST, AT I, @oe 4, |, 329, qrir@ 20 73, 2026 H TH1{AdT gT A1’

INSOLVENCY AND BANKRUPTCY BOARD OF INDIA
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 1st June, 2026
Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board of India (Liquidation Process) (Fourth Amendment) Regulations, 2026

F. No. IBBI/2026-27/GN/REG151.—In exercise of the powers conferred by clause (t) of sub-section (1) of
section 196 read with section 240 of the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Code, 2016 (31 of 2016), the Insolvency and
Bankruptcy Board of India hereby makes the following regulations to further amend the Insolvency and Bankruptcy
Board of India (Liquidation Process) Regulations, 2016, namely: -

1. (1) These regulations may be called the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board of India (Liquidation Process) (Fourth
Amendment) Regulations, 2026.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board of India (Liquidation Process) Regulations, 2016, (hereinafter referred to as
‘the principal regulations’), in regulation 2, in sub-regulation (1):-

(1) for clause (ba), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-
“(ba) “committee” means a committee of creditors constituted under section 21;”.
(i1) in clause (ea),

(a) sub-clause (v) shall be omitted.

(b) sub-clause (vii) shall be omitted.



14 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC.4]

3. In the principal regulations, for regulation 2A, the following regulation shall be substituted, namely:-
“2A. Contributions to liquidation costs.

The liquidator may call upon the members of the committee to contribute the excess of the liquidation costs
over the liquid assets of the corporate debtor, as estimated by him, in such manner and subject to such terms
and conditions as approved by the committee.”

4. In the principal regulations, in regulation 2B, after the third proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:-

“Provided further that no compromise or arrangement under section 230 of the Companies Act, 2013 shall be
filed by the liquidator unless—

(a) such compromise or arrangement has been approved by requisite majority of creditors as provided in sub-
section (6) of section 230 of the Companies Act, 2013; and

(b) the amount realisable to the creditors under the proposed compromise or arrangement is higher than the
liquidation value determined as on the insolvency commencement date.”

5. In the principal regulations, after regulation 3, the following regulation shall be inserted, namely:-
“3A. Recommendation of liquidator by committee of creditors.

(1) For the purposes of sub-section (1) of section 34 of the Code, the committee shall, prior to the passing of
the order for liquidation, recommend the name of an insolvency professional from the panel of insolvency
professionals prepared by the Board in this regard, for appointment as liquidator.

(2) The recommendation under sub-regulation (1) shall be made by a vote of not less than sixty-six per cent.
of the voting share of the committee.

(3) Upon receipt of the recommendation under sub-regulation (2), the Adjudicating Authority shall consider
such recommendation while appointing the liquidator.”

6. In the principal regulations, for regulation 4, the following regulation shall be substituted, namely:-

“4. Liquidator’s fee.

(1) The committee may fix the fee of the liquidator in the first meeting after the appointment of liquidator
during the liquidation process, in accordance with sub-section (8) of section 34.

(2) If the committee has not fixed the fee under sub-regulation (1), the fee as a percentage of the amount
distributed to the stakeholders, for the balance period of liquidation, will be as under:

Amount of Distribution (In Percentage of fee on the amount distributed
rupees
upees) in the first in the next six thereafter
six months months

Amount Distributed to Stakeholders (exclusive of liquidation costs)

On the first 1 crore 5.00 4.00 2.0
On the next 9 crore 4.00 3.00 1.50
On the next 40 crore 2.50 2.0 1.0
On the next 50 crore 1.25 1.0 0.50
On further sums realized 0.25 0.20 0.10

Explanation.- It is hereby clarified that the requirements of this regulation shall apply to the liquidation
processes commencing on or after the date of the commencement of the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board of
India (Liquidation Process) (Fourth Amendment) Regulations, 2026.”

7. In the principal regulations, in regulation 5:-
(i) for sub-regulation (1), the following sub-regulation shall be substituted, namely:-
“(1) The liquidator shall prepare and submit:

(a) progress report(s); and



[|TT III—ETE 4] HTL T (ST ETLTI0T 15

(b) the final report prior to dissolution:
to the Adjudicating Authority in the manner specified under these Regulations.”
(i1) in sub-regulation (2), the words “and minutes” shall be omitted.

(iii) in sub-regulation (3), for the words “make the reports and minutes”, the words “make the reports” shall be
substituted.

8. In the principal regulations, in regulation 7, in sub-regulation (1), after the words “may appoint professionals” the
words “with the approval of the committee” shall be inserted.

9. In the principal regulations, for regulation 8, the following regulations shall be substituted, namely:-
“8. Committee of creditors.

(1) The committee of creditors constituted under section 21 shall continue to function during the liquidation
process:

Provided that a secured creditor who has not relinquished his security interest under section 52 shall not be part
of the committee.

Provided further that with reference to Explanation in clause (b) in sub-section (1) of section 53, the creditor
whose value of debt remains and is considered as unsecured creditor shall be a part of the committee for the
remaining portion of debt and shall have the voting rights to the value of the remaining debt.

Explanation: For the purposes of Explanation in clause (b) in sub-section (1) of section 53, the value of security
interest shall be the liquidation value determined in accordance with Regulation 35.

(2) The provisions of regulations 18 to 26 of Chapter VI and Chapter VII of the Insolvency and Bankruptcy
Board of India (Insolvency Resolution Process for Corporate Persons) Regulations, 2016 shall apply mutatis
mutandis to meetings of the committee under liquidation proceedings:

Provided that the first meeting of the committee shall be convened within seven days of liquidation
commencement date.

(3) In every meeting, the liquidator shall present to the committee:
(a) the actual liquidation cost along with reasons for exceeding the estimated cost, if any;
(b) the consolidated status of all the legal proceedings; and
(c) the progress made in the process.
(4) The liquidator shall not undertake the following without the prior approval of the committee:
(a) appointment and remuneration of professionals appointed under regulation 7,
(b) fees of the liquidator;
(c) liquidation costs;
(d) valuation under sub- regulation (2) of regulation 35;
(e) continuation or institution of any suits or legal proceedings by or against the corporate debtor;

(f) extension of payment of balance sale consideration as provided in clause (12) of Para 1 of Schedule
I, beyond ninety days, to be disclosed in the auction notice;

(g) appropriate arrangement for pursuing any suit or proceedings with regard to distribution of
proceeds in reference to sub-section (1B) of section 54;

(h) any other matter or activity relating to the liquidation process except those listed in sub-regulation
(5), as may be decided by the committee.

(5) The liquidator shall not undertake the following without the prior approval of the committee obtained by a
voting share of not less than sixty-six per cent., in matters relating to:

(a) sale under regulation 32, including manner of sale, pre-bid qualifications, reserve price, marketing
strategy and auction process;

(b) the manner in which proceedings in respect of preferential transactions, undervalued transaction,
extortionate credit transaction or fraudulent or wrongful trading, if any, shall be pursued after
dissolution of the corporate debtor and the manner in which the proceeds, if any, from these
proceedings shall be distributed; and



16 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC.4]

(c) assignment of not readily realisable assets.

(6) The committee shall have access to all relevant records and information as may be required by the
committee.

(7) The authorised representative, appointed during the corporate insolvency resolution process, shall continue
to act as the authorised representative of such creditors in the liquidation process and the provisions of sub-
regulations (3A) to (12) of regulation 16A of the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board of India (Insolvency
Resolution Process for Corporate Persons) Regulations, 2016 shall apply mutatis mutandis.

8A. Facilitation of transfer of assets.

(1) Where the corporate debtor is a corporate guarantor undergoing a liquidation process, the liquidator of such
corporate debtor which has given the corporate guarantee shall coordinate with the resolution professional of
the corporate debtor to whom such guarantee has been given, regarding transfer of asset in the corporate
insolvency resolution process of the corporate debtor to whom such guarantee has been given.

(2) For the purposes of section 28A, the liquidator shall obtain approval from the committee of the corporate
debtor which has given the corporate guarantee for transfer of asset in the corporate insolvency resolution
process of the corporate debtor to whom such guarantee has been given.

(3) Where approval is granted by the committee of the corporate debtor as corporate guarantor permitting the
transfer, the liquidator of such corporate debtor shall ensure that the proposed transfer is appropriately disclosed
in the progress report and asset memorandum.

8B. Replacement of liquidator.

The committee may by a vote of not less than sixty-six per cent., propose to replace the liquidator and shall file
an application, after obtaining the written consent of the proposed liquidator in such format as notified by the
Board, before the Adjudicating Authority for replacement of the liquidator:

Provided that where a liquidator is proposed to be replaced, he shall continue to work till his replacement.”

10. In the principal regulations, in regulation 9, in sub-regulation (1), in clause (a), after the words “partner of the
corporate debtor” the words “or any other person referred to in sub-section (3) of section 34” shall be inserted.

11. In the principal regulations, in regulation 10, in sub-regulation (1), for the words “in pursuance of the contract, make
an application to the Adjudicating Authority within six months from the liquidation commencement date, or such
extended period as may be allowed by the Adjudicating Authority, to disclaim the property or contract”, the words “in
pursuance of the contract, make an application, after seeking approval from the committee, before the Adjudicating
Authority within ninety days from the liquidation commencement date, or such extended period as may be allowed by
the Adjudicating Authority, to disclaim the property or contract” shall be substituted.

12. In the principal regulations, in regulation 12:-

(1) in sub-regulation (1), for the words “Form B of Schedule II” the words “such format as notified by the Board” shall
be substituted.

(ii) sub-regulation (2), shall be omitted.

13. In the principal regulations, in regulation 13: -

(i) for the words “Adjudicating Authority” the word “committee” shall be substituted.
(ii) for the words "seventy-five” the word "thirty” shall be substituted.

14. In the principal regulations, in regulation 14, for the words “he shall consult the consultation committee and if it
advises for early dissolution, he may apply, along with a detailed report incorporating the views of the consultation
committee, to the Adjudicating Authority for early dissolution of the corporate debtor and for necessary directions in
respect of such dissolution”, the words “he shall place the agenda in this regard before the committee and if it decides
by a voting share of not less than sixty-six per cent. for early dissolution, he shall apply, along with a detailed report
incorporating the decision of the committee, to the Adjudicating Authority for early dissolution of the corporate debtor
and for necessary directions in respect of such dissolution” shall be substituted.

15. In the principal regulations, in regulation 15:-

(i) in sub-regulation (1), after the words “stipulated by the Board, to” the words "be placed before the committee” shall
be inserted.

(i1) in sub-regulation (2), for clause (b), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-

“(b) a statement indicating progress in liquidation, including-



[|TT III—ETE 4] HTL T (ST ETLTI0T 17

(1) minutes of meetings of the committee,

(i1) asset memorandum,

(iii) sale report(s),

(iv) settlement of list of stakeholders,

(v) details of any property that remains to be sold and realised,
(vi) distribution made to the stakeholders, and

(vii) distribution of unsold property made to the stakeholders;”

(iii) in sub-regulation (5), for the illustration, the following illustration shall be substituted, namely:-

“Illustration: An insolvency professional becomes a liquidator on 13 February, 2026, and ceases to act as liquidator
on 12" June, 2026. He shall submit Progress Reports as under:

Report No. Period covered in the Quarter Last Date of Submission of Report
1 13" February - 31%March, 2026 15" April, 2026
2 April — 12" June, 2026 27" June, 2026

He shall submit the audited accounts of his receipts and payments as under:

Audited Account No. Period covered in the Year Last Date of Submission
1 13" February - 315 March, 2026 15" April, 2026
2 April — 12 June, 2026 27" June, 2026

2

16. In the principal regulations, in regulation 16,

(i) in sub-regulation (1), for the words “shall submit its claim, or update its claim submitted during the
corporate insolvency resolution process, including interest, if any, on or before the last date mentioned in the
public announcement.”, the words “shall submit its claim where not submitted during the corporate insolvency
resolution process as on insolvency commencement date, within fourteen days of the liquidation
commencement date.” shall be substituted.

(i1) in sub-regulation (2), for the words “including interest, if any, as on the liquidation commencement date”,
the words “for the newly submitted claims, if any, as on the insolvency commencement date” shall be
substituted.

(iii) after sub-regulation (2), the following sub-regulation shall be inserted, namely:-

“(3) A stakeholder shall update its claim as and when the claim is satisfied, partly or fully, from any
source in any manner, after the insolvency commencement date.”

17. In the principal regulations, in regulation 17, in sub-regulation (1), for the words “Form C of Schedule I1”, the words
"such format as notified by the Board” shall be substituted.

18. In the principal regulations, in regulation 18, in sub-regulation (1), for the words “Form D of Schedule II”, the words
"such format as notified by the Board” shall be substituted.

19. In the principal regulations, in regulation 19: -

(i) in sub-regulation (1), for the words “Form E of Schedule II”, the words “such format as notified by the
Board” shall be substituted.

(i1) in sub-regulation (2), for the words “Form F of Schedule II”, the words “such format as notified by the
Board” shall be substituted.

20. In the principal regulations, in regulation 20, in sub-regulation (1), for the words “Form G of Schedule I1”, the words
"such format as notified by the Board” shall be substituted.

21. In the principal regulations, in regulation 21A:-

(1) in the marginal heading, for the word “Presumption”, the word “Relinquishment” shall be substituted.



18 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC.4]

(i1) in sub-regulation (1),
(a) after the words “A secured creditor” the words ““,within fourteen days,” shall be inserted.

(b) for the words “Form C or Form D of Schedule II”, the words “such format as notified by the Board” shall
be substituted.

(iii) in the proviso to sub-regulation (1),
(a) for the word “thirty days” the words “fourteen days” shall be substituted.
(b) for the word “presumed” the words “deemed to be relinquished” shall be substituted.
(c) the words “be part of” shall be omitted.
(iv) in sub-regulation (2),
(a) in clause (a), for the word “ninety”, the words “forty-five” shall be substituted.
(b) 1in clause (b), for the word “one hundred and eighty”, the words “ninety” shall be substituted.

22. In the principal regulations, in regulation 28, sub-regulation (1), for the words ‘liquidation commencement date’,
the words ‘insolvency commencement date’ shall be substituted.

23. In the principal regulations, for regulation 30, the following regulations shall be substituted, namely:-
“30. Verification of claims.

(1) The liquidator shall verify the claims received under sub-regulation (1) of regulation 16, within seven days
of receipt of claim and may either admit or reject the claim, in whole or in part, as the case may be.

(2) The liquidator shall also verify the claims which were received but were not verified during the corporate
insolvency resolution process, within seven days of the liquidation commencement date and may either admit
or reject the claim, in whole or in part, as the case may be:

Provided that the liquidator shall not re-verify the claim, which has already been verified during the corporate
insolvency resolution process:

Provided further that where the liquidator rejects a claim, he shall record in writing the reasons for such
rejection.

(3) The liquidator shall communicate his decision of admission or rejection of claims along with reasons, to
the stakeholder within seven days of such admission or rejection of claims.”

24. In the principal regulations, in regulation 31, in sub-regulation (2), for the words “forty-five”, the words “thirty”
shall be substituted.

25. In the principal regulations, regulation 31A shall be omitted.
26. In the principal regulations, after the proviso to regulation 32, the following clarification shall be inserted, namely:-

“Clarification: It is hereby clarified that the liquidator shall not sell any immovable and movable property or
actionable claims of the corporate debtor in liquidation to any person who is ineligible to be a resolution
applicant under section 29A.”

27. In the principal regulations, regulation 32B shall be omitted.
28. In the principal regulations, in regulation 33:
(i) in sub-regulation (1), the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:-

“Provided that the liquidator shall not sell the assets without prior permission of the Adjudicating Authority
under this sub-regulation to:

(a) arelated party of the corporate debtor subject to proviso to clause (f) of sub-section (1) of Section 35;
(b) his related party; or
(c) any professional appointed by him.”

(i1) for sub-regulation (2), the following sub-regulation shall be substituted, namely:-

“(2) The liquidator may sell the assets of the corporate debtor by means of private sale only after prior approval
of the committee with voting share of sixty six per cent., in the manner specified in Schedule I when -

(a)  the asset is perishable;

(b)  the asset is likely to deteriorate in value significantly if not sold immediately; or



[|TT III—ETE 4] HTL T (ST ETLTI0T 19

(¢)  the permission of the Adjudicating Authority has been obtained for such sale:
Provided that the liquidator shall not sell the assets, by way of private sale to-
(a) arelated party of the corporate debtor;
(b) his related party; or
(c) any professional appointed by him.”
29. In the principal regulations, in regulation 34: -
(i) in sub-regulation (1A), for the word “seventy-five” the word “forty-five” shall be substituted.
(i) in sub-regulation (2),
(a) in clause (a), after the words “value of the asset”, the words “under regulation 32” shall be inserted.
(b) clause (b) shall be omitted.
(iii) in sub-regulation (4), for the word “preliminary”, the word “progress” shall be substituted.
(iv) in sub-regulation (5), the words “members of the consultation” and “having voting rights” shall be omitted.
30. In the principal regulations, in regulation 35: -
(1) for sub-regulation (2), the following sub-regulation shall be substituted, namely:-

“(2) In cases not covered under sub-regulation (1) or where the committee, is of the opinion that fresh
valuation is required under the circumstances, the liquidator shall within seven days of the liquidation
commencement date, appoint two registered valuers to determine the realisable value of the assets under
regulation 32 of the corporate debtor:

Provided that the following persons shall not be appointed as registered valuers, namely: -
(a) a relative of the liquidator;
(b) a related party of the corporate debtor;

(c) an auditor of the corporate debtor at any time during the five years preceding the insolvency
commencement date; or

(d) a partner or director of the insolvency professional entity of which the liquidator is a partner or
director.”

(ii) in sub-regulation (3), the words “or businesses, as the case may be” shall be omitted.
(iii) in sub-regulation (4), the words “or businesses” shall be omitted.
(iv) in sub-regulation (5), the word “consultation” shall be omitted.
(v) in sub-regulation (6), the words “members of the consultation” shall be omitted.
(vi) in sub-regulation (7), the word “consultation” shall be omitted.
31. In the principal regulations, in regulation 37, in sub-regulation (2):-
(i) for the words “twenty one” the word “seven” shall be substituted.
(i1) for the words "thirty” the words "fourteen” shall be substituted.
32. In the principal regulations, in regulation 37A, in sub-regulation (1): -
(i) for the words “in consultation with” the words “with prior approval of” shall be substituted.
(i1) the words "stakeholders’ consultation” and “in accordance with regulation 31A” shall be omitted.

(iii) in the explanation to sub-regulation (1), after the words “section 66 of the Code” the words and mark *,
whether crystallised or not” shall be inserted.

33. In the principal regulations, in regulation 38, in sub-regulation (1), after the words “The liquidator may,”, the words
“after approval of the committee and” shall be inserted.

34. In the principal regulations, in regulation 40, in the explanation, the word “,business” shall be omitted.

35. In the principal regulations, in regulation 41, in sub-regulation (3), for the words “Adjudicating Authority”, the word
“committee” shall be substituted.



20 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC.4]

36. In the principal regulations, in regulation 42: -
(1) in sub-regulation (1), the words “and the asset memorandum” shall be omitted.
(i1) in sub-regulation (2), for the word “ninety days”, the word “fifteen days” shall be substituted.
37. In the principal regulations, in regulation 44: -
(i) in sub-regulation (1), for the word “one year”, the words “one hundred and eighty days” shall be substituted.

(ii) in sub-regulation (2), for the words “one year”, the words “one hundred and eighty days” shall be
substituted.

(iii) in sub-regulation (2), after the words “he shall” the words “, on receiving an instruction from the committee
under this regulation” shall be inserted.

(iv) after sub-regulation (2), the following clarification shall be inserted:-

“Clarification: It is clarified that the liquidator shall continue to discharge his responsibilities under
the liquidation process, till the application for extension is decided by the Adjudicating Authority.”

(v) in the explanation to sub-regulation (2), for the term “Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board of India
(Liquidation Process) (Amendment) Regulations, 2019” the term “Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board of India
(Liquidation Process) (Fourth Amendment) Regulations, 2026 shall be substituted.

38. In the principal regulations, in regulation 44A,
(i) for the words “on the advice”, the words “with the approval” shall be substituted.
(i1) the word “consultation” shall be omitted.

39. In the principal regulations, in regulation 45, for sub-regulations (2) and (3), the following regulation shall be
substituted, namely:-

“(2) The liquidator shall submit an application along with the final report and the compliance certificate in such
format as notified by the Board to the Adjudicating Authority for the dissolution of the corporate debtor or
closure of the liquidation process.”

40. In the principal regulations, in regulation 45A: -
(1) in clause (e) of sub-regulation (2), the word “consultation” shall be omitted.
(i1) in clause (i), the words “going concern sale in liquidation process or” shall be omitted.

(iii) in clause (n) of sub-regulation (2), the words “preliminary report, asset memorandum,” and “asset sale
report, annual status report” shall be omitted.

(iv) sub-regulation (5) shall be omitted.

41. In the principal regulations, in regulation 46, in sub-regulation (5), (7) and (7D), for the word “Form-I”, the words
“such format as notified by the Board” shall be substituted.

42. In the principal regulations, for regulation 47, the following regulation shall be substituted, namely:-
“47. Model time-line for liquidation process.

The following Table presents a model timeline of liquidation process of a corporate debtor from the liquidation
commencement date, assuming that the process does not include compromise or arrangement under section 230 of the
Companies Act, 2013 (18 of 2013) :

Model Timeline for Liquidation Process

SI. | Section Description of Task Norm Latest
No. / Timeline
Regulat (Days)
ion
(1 2 3) “4) )
1 | Section | Commencement of liquidation and | LCD 0=T
33 and | appointment of liquidator
34
2 | Section | Public announcement Within 5 days of appointment of T+5
33 (1) liquidator.




[|TT III—ETE 4] HTL T (ST ETLTI0T 21

(b) (i) /
Reg. 12
3 | Reg. 35 | Appointment of registered valuers Within 7 days of LCD T+7
2
4 | Reg. 8 First meeting of committee of creditors | Within 7 days of LCD T+7
5 | Reg. 16 | Submission of claims; Within 14 days of LCD T+ 14
/ Sec. 52 — —
Intimation of decision on
and reg. L o
21A relinquishment of security interest
6 | Reg.30 | Verification of claims received under | Within 7 days of receipt of claims T+21
regulation 16
7 | Reg.30 | Intimation  about decision of | Within 7 days of admission or rejection T+28
acceptance/ rejection of claim of claim
8 | Reg. 31 | Filing the list of stakeholders Within 30 days from the last date of T+44
2) receipt of claims
9 | Reg. 15 | Submission of progress reports to AA | First progress report Ql+15
Second progress report Q2+15
10 | Proviso | Progress report in case of cessation of | Within 15 days of cessation as liquidator Date of
to Reg. | liquidator cessation +
15 15
11 | Reg. 42 | Distribution of the proceeds to the | Within 15 days from the receipt of Date of
2) stakeholders amount Realisation +
15
12 | Reg. 44 | Liquidation of corporate debtor. Within 180 days T+ 180
13 | [Reg. Deposit the amount of unclaimed | Before submission of application under
46 dividends and undistributed proceeds | sub-regulation (2) of regulation 45
14 | Sch-1 Time period to H1 bidder to provide | Within 90 days of the date of invitation
Sl.  No | balance sale consideration to provide the balance amount. ]
12

[AA: Adjudicating Authority, LCD: Liquidation Commencement Date]

43. In the principal regulations, in Schedule I, in clause 1:-

(i) sub-clause (1A) shall be omitted.
(i1) in sub-clause (1B), the word “consultation” shall be omitted.
(iii) in sub-clause (1B), for the word “advises” the word “decides” shall be substituted.

(iv) in sub-clause (4), after the words “be further reduced”, the words and marks “, with the approval of the
committee,”, shall be inserted.

(v) the proviso to sub-clause (4) shall be omitted.

(vi) in sub-clause (11A), after the words “Where the liquidator” the words “, with the approval of the committee
with voting share of sixty-six per cent.,” shall be inserted.

(vii) in sub-clause (12B), the words “consultation” and “under regulation 31A”, shall be omitted.

(viii) in sub-clause (12C), for the words “consultation with the consultation committee”, the words “the
approval of the committee with voting share of sixty-six per cent.” shall be substituted.

(ix) in sub-clause (12E), for the words “the liquidator may, in consultation with the consultation committee”,
the words “the liquidator may, with the approval of the committee with voting share of sixty-six per cent.”
shall be substituted.

(x) in sub-clause (13), after the words “to transfer such assets”, the words “with the approval of the committee
with voting share of sixty-six per cent” shall be inserted.



22 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC.4]

44. In the principal regulations, in Schedule I, in clause 2, in sub-clause (3A), for the words “after consultation with the
consultation committee under regulation 33” the words "in compliance with regulation 33” shall be substituted.

45. In the principal regulations, Schedule II shall be omitted.

RAVI MITAL, Chairperson
[ADVT.-111I/4/Exty./140/2026-27]

Note: The Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board of India (Liquidation Process) Regulations, 2016 were published vide
notification No. IBBI/2016-17/GN/REG005, dated 15" December, 2016 in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary,
Part I11, Section 4, vide No. 460 on 15" December, 2016 and were last amended by the Insolvency and Bankruptcy
Board of India (Liquidation Process) (Third Amendment) Regulations, 2026 published vide notification No.
IBB1/2026-27/GN/REG 142, dated the 19" May, 2026 in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part III, Section 4,
No.329 on 20" May, 2026.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.

KUMER CHAND Qiien oo mecin
MEENA Dt 0280603
o



		2026-06-03T13:32:54+0530
	KUMER CHAND MEENA




