FORM A
PUBLIC ANNOUNCEMENT

(Under Regulation 6 of the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board of India (Insolvency Resolution Process
for Corporate Persons) Regulations, 2016)

FOR THE ATTENTION OF THE CREDITORS OF B N G GLOBAL INDIA LIMITED

RELEVANT PARTICULARS
1. | Name of corporate debtor B N G GLOBAL INDIA LIMITED
2. | Date of incorporation of corporate debtor 22.09.2011
3. | Authority under which corporate debtor is | ROC — DELHI
incorporated / registered
4. | Corporate Identity No. / Limited Liability | U52590DL2011PLC225377
Identification No. of corporate debtor
5. | Address of the registered office and principal | GD. ITL A-09 NORTHEX TOWER 5TH
office (if any) of corporate debtor FLOOR 504 NSP PITAMPURA DELHI North
Delhi DL 110034 IN
6. | Insolvency commencement date in respect of | 17.03.2023
corporate debtor
7. | Estimated date of closure of insolvency | 13.09.2023 (180 days from the date of
resolution process commencement of resolution process)
8. | Name and registration number of the | Harish Taneja
insolvency professional acting as interim | IBBI/IPA-002/IP-N00088/2017-18/10229
resolution professional
9. | Address and e-mail of the interim resolution | 236-L, Model Town, Near Mukhija hospital,
professional, as registered with the Board Sonipat -131001
harishtaneja78(@gmail.com
10. | Address and e-mail to be wused for |302, R G Trade Tower, Netaji Subhash Place,
correspondence with the interim resolution | Pitampura, New Delhi — 110034
professional cirp.bngglobal@gmail.com
11. | Last date for submission of claims 31.03.2023 i.e., 14 days from appointment of
Interim Resolution Professional
12. | Class of Creditors, If any, Under Clause(B) of | Investors in the collective Investment Scheme(s)
Sub-Section(6A) of Section 21, Ascertained | floated by the Corporate Debtor
by Interim Resolution Professional Class 1: Creditors who opted for Lump sum
Investment Plan
Class 2: Creditors who opted for Recurring
Investment Plan
13. | Name of Insolvency Professionals identified || Class of Creditors Name of Insolvency
to act as Representative of creditors in a class Professional
Class 1 1. Mr. Amit Talwar
2. Mr. Gagan Gulati
3. Mr. Rajiv Bajaj
Class 2 1. Mr. Avneesh
Srivastava
2. Mr. Alok Kaushik
3. Mr. Nitin Kochhar
14. | (a). Relevant Forms and a) Weblink:

(b). Details of Authorized Representative
Available at:

https://ibbi.gov.in/en/home/downloads
b) Weblink: https://ibbi.gov.in/en/insolvency-
professional
Address: 302, R.G. Trade Tower, Netaji Subhash
Place, Pitampura, New Delhi-110034




Notice is hereby given that the National Company Law Tribunal has ordered the commencement of a
corporate insolvency resolution process of the B N G Global India Limited on 17.03.2023.

The creditors of B N G Global India Limited are hereby called upon to submit their claims with proof
on or before 31.03.2023 falling fourteen days from the appointment of the interim resolution
professional to the interim resolution professional at the address mentioned against entry No. 11.

The claims may be submitted in specified form in terms of regulations 7, 8, 9 and 9A of The
Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board of India (Insolvency Process for Corporate Persons) Regulations
2016, by the Operational Creditors (except workmen and employees) in “Form B”, Financial Creditors
in “Form C”, workman or an Employee in “Form D”, Authorised Representative of Workmen and
Employees in “Form E”, Any other Stakeholder in “Form F”.

The financial creditors shall submit their claims with proof by electronic means only. All other
creditors may submit the claims with proof in person, by post or by electronic means.

A financial creditor belonging to a class, as listed against the entry no. 12, shall indicate its choice of
authorized representative from among the three insolvency professionals listed against entry no.13 to

act as authorized of the class mentioned in entry no. 12 above, in Form CA.

Submission of false or misleading proofs of claim shall attract penalties.

Date: 18.03.2023
Place: New Delhi

(Harish Taneja)
Interim Resolution Professional
BNG Global India Limited
Reg no. IBBI/IPA-002/TP-N00088/2017-18/10229
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FORM A

PUBLIC ANNOUNCEMENT

[Under Regulation & of the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board of India
(Insolvency Resolution Pracess for Corporate Persons) Regulations, 2016]

FOR THE ATTENTION OF THE CREDITORS OF B N G GLOBAL INDIA LIMITED

RELEVANT PARTICULARS

I. |Name of Corporate Debtor

B N G GLOBAL INDIA LIMITED

2. |Date of incorparation of Comparate Debtar

2208301

4, [Authority under which Corparate Debtor ig
noorporaled { registered

4. |Comarate Identity No. |/ Limited Liakdlity
Ientification ke, of Corporate Detilor

Regakar of Companies, Delhi

LEZ2550DL F0 1 PLCZ253TT

(=41

. |Address of the regisiered office and

{inscivency commencemeni date i
respect of Corporate [ebtor

'_1:-:

GO, ML A-0, Mortheax Tower, 5th Floor, 504 MSP
principal offica (# any) of Corporate Debior | Fitampura, Defhi, Marth Delhi-110034 N
17.03.2023

7. | Estimeated date of closure of insotvwency
rasolulion procass

13.09.2023 (180 days from the date of ¢
ol raselutan procass)

OMIMEnCement

Harizh Taneja

B. [Mame and Regatation number of the
Reg. Mo.: IBBYIFA-DDNP-MNOOCER2017-18M0228

nsolvency professional acting as Intanm
Resolufion Frofassiana

0| &ddress & email of the mierim rErs::-:ull"n
professicnal, &5 registered with the board

Z36-L, Model Town, Near Mukhija Hosoial, Sanipal -
131001 Email: harishtaneja? @ gmail.com

10| Address and a-mail to be used for
correspandance with tha Inerim
Resolution Professional

352. R G Trade Toaer, Netaj Subhash Place,
Pirampura, New Delhi - 110034
Emiail: n:lrs:- hngglubal@gma i.com

31.03.2023 | e, 14 days from ap:..dr ment of Interim
Resoiutian Frafe-aamal,;

11.| Lastdate for submission of claims

12| Clagses of credions, fany, under daisa (k) | Invesiors in the collective Iresimant Soheme]s)

of sub-section (4} of saction 21, ascartained | Moaled by e Comporate Debaor

by the Inlerim Resohitlon Professicnal Class 1: Cradilars who opbed for Lump sum Invastiment Flan
Class & Creditors whi opted for Recuring Irwestment Plan

13.| Names of insohency professionals identiliad | Ciaas of Crediars | Mame of Insabency Pralessonal
toact as authornmesd representatveal credions Glaes 1 1. Mr, Amil Takuar
In@ciass {thres names for eachclass) 2. Mr. Gagan Gulati
3 Mr. Rajv Bajaj
Clags 2 1. Mr, Awnieesh Snvastava

2. Mr, Aok Kaughik
| 3. Mr. Niin Kinchhar

SALE NOTICE
M/s UTM ENGINEERING PRIVATE LIMITED {IN LIGUIDATION)
ClIN; L18107DL24PTES [IE-E‘n
2, Block B Ugrasen Park,

Registered Office: Plot No. 26/27/28, Gali no.
Nanglol Road, Najafgarh, Dulhl 110043

E-AUCTION SALE NOTICE
UNDER INSOLVENCY AND BANKRUPTCY CODE, 2016

Motice is hereby given to the publicin general under the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Code,
2016 and the regulations made theraunder that the assels of Mis UTM Engineering
Private Limited (in Liguidation) ("Corporate Debtor™) are being proposed 1o be sold on
standalone basis/collectively 'on percel basis as perRegulalion 32 (a) or Regulation 32(c)
or Regulation 32(d) of the Insolvency and Bankrupicy Board of india (Liquidation Process)
Regulations, 2018, on “AS ISWHERE 15", “AS |5 WHAT 13", "WHATEVER THERE I15”
AND “WITHOUT RECOURSE BASIS™ through e-auction platform. The said proposition
for disposition is without any kind of warranties and indemnibies

The bidding of the assets stated in the below table shall take place through the online -
auction service provider, Mis e-Procurement Technologies Limited - Auction Tiger via the
wehsite https:/Incltauction.auctiontiger.net

submission of Reguisite Forms, | From 200032023 to 03.04.2023

Affidavits, Declaration e,

Sitevisitd Inspection Date From 07,04 202310 12.04.2023

Last Date for Submission of EMD 1704, 2023 by 05.00 P.M

BLOCK A

Date: 19.04 2023, Time: 11:00AM to 01:00 PM
[With an undimiled extension of S Ming)
BELOCKEB

Date: 20.04 2023, Time: 11:00AM to 01:00 PM
[With an undimiled exlension ol S Mins)
BLOCKC

Drate: 21.04.2023, Time: 17:00AM to 01:00 PM
{With an unlimited extension of 5 Mins)

Date and Time of Auction

BLOCK A

Following block of assets available for sale in e-auchon as per Regulation 32(c) of the
Insohienty and Bankruptcy Board of Indka (Liquidation Process) Regulations, 2016

14, (a) Relevan foms avad gle &l
ih) Datals of authorized representatives
arg availablie at

(a) Web link: hitps:\fawwibbi.govinhomeidownloads
() Weblink: hips.ibtposineninsshencyprolessonal
Addresg: 302 RG. Trade Tower, Metai Subhash
Place, Pitampura, New Dalhi-110034

Mobca is heretn' gaan thal e Maticnal Company Law Trbural bas orderad the commencemant of a :

corparate insplvency resoluson progess of the B NG Global India Limited on 17032023,

The creditars of BN G Global India Limibed ane haneby cabed upon fesubmi thelr claims with proal anor
bafore 31.03.2023 faling fourteen days from tha appointmerd af tha interim resalution prafessional fo the
ireren rescition professsonal at the addness mentioned againstentry Moo 11

Tz cladms may be subenitted inspecified farm in bemms of regulations 7, &, 9 ard 98 of The Insobsency and
Bankruplcy Board of kndia {Insolvancy Procass for Comporata Persons) Regulations 2018, by tha
Coerational Crediors (except workmen and employess) in “Form B°, Financlal Creditars in “Foem C°
wirkman or an Emplayes in “Fom [°, Aufhorisad Represantalive of 'Workmen and Employeas in “Fom
E°, Anyather Stakeholdar in “Farm F

The firancial creditors shal submi theirofams with proof by electranic means only, &l other creditars may
s e claires with proalin person, by post o by slecinonic means.

& financial creditor belenging to a dass, as lisled agams! e enlry na. 12, shall indicate its choacs o
autharzed reprasentative from amang the fhrae insclvency profeasionals listed against entry no, 13 ko ast
A% A lhanz i of (e class merloned inenry no. 12 abawe, in Form GA,

Submission of false or misleading proofs of claim shall attract penalties.

Harish Taneja
Date ; 18022023 Intersm Resgiution Frofessional ior & N G GLOBAL IR LIMaT ED
Place: Mew e ' Regn. No.: 1BBI/IPA-0D2/IP-NODDSE20 T-1810229

BEFORE THE CENTRAL
GOVERNMENT, REGISTRAR OF
COMPANIES, DELHI & HARYANA

Advertisement for change of Registered Office

Classifieds

of the LLP from one State to another
In the matter of sub-section (3) of Section 13

— PERSONAC

of Limited Liability Partnership Act, 2008 and

. rule 17 of the Limited Liability Partnership
I,LRavinder Kumar,S/o Rules, 2009

Ramnath Sharma R/0.H.No.F- AND
175,Street No.3,Ankur In the matter of POVAMI DIGITAL
Enclave,Karawal Nagar,Delhi- MARKETING SERVICES LLP

D‘ {3 Kma from Katra towards Feasi Road

31, No.|Description of Block Reserve Price (in INR) [ EMD {in INR)

1 Plant & Machinery at Dausa, Fajasthan 10,08, 147
{=ituated at Laksof Tunnel), Katra, J&K
{3 Kms fram Kalra lowards Reasi Road
= Shérwar) and Udaipur, Rajasthan
{=ituated at Zawar Mines).

1,00,81,476

OR

BLOCK B
{Only in the event where no bid is received for Block A,
bids received for Block B would be considered.)
Following block of assets avaitable for sale in e-auction as per Fegulafion 32{d} of the
Insolvency and Bankrupicy Board of India (Liquidation Process) Regulations, 2016

“Form Mo, INC-26"
[Fursuant to rule 30 of the Companies

findiasheiter |ND|IA SHELTER FINANCE CORPORATION LTD.

{incorporation) Rules, 2014] Home Loans

Advertisement to be published in the
newspaper for change of registered office
of the Company from one state fo another

Befora the Central Government
Morthern Region
In the mater of sub-saction [4) of Section 13
of Comparies. Act, 2013 and clavse [(a) of
sub-rule (5] of nae 30 of the Companies
(Incosporaton) Rubas, 2014
AND

In the matter of Zitren India Pvt Lid having ils

immavabda properies morigagedicharged to the Sacured Creddar, tha

Registerad Office: PLOT-15,6TH FLOOR, SEC-44, INSTITUTHIMAL AREA, GURUGRAM, HARYANA-1 22002,
Branch Office: B-X10, Deekay Tower, Vibhuti Khnd, Gomti Nagar Lucknow U.P 226010,

PUELIC NOTICE- AUCTION FOR SALE OF IMMOVABLE PROPERTY

[UMDER RULE 9{1) OF THE SECURITY INTEREST [ENFORCEMENT) RULES, 2002

NOTICE FOR SALE OF IMMOVAELE PROPERTY/s MORTGAGED WITH india Sheller Finance Corperation (ISFC) [(SECURED CREDITOR) UNDER
THE SECURITISATION AND RECONSTRIUCTEON OF FINAMCLAL ASSETS AMD ENFORCEMEMT OF SECURITY INTEREST ACT, 2002

Maties s hereby given 1o the public in general and In pamticidar o the barowen's) and guaranton s of thelr legal helrs! representatives thal the below described
passassion of which has bean takan by the Authorizad Officer of ISFC [sacured
credilor), wil be sold oo 06.04.2023 (Date of Auction) on "A5 IS WHERE I5°, A3 |3 WHAT 15" and "WHAT EVER THERE 15" basis for recovary of
autsianding dusas from below mendioned Barmowers, Co- Bomawers or Guareniors, The Resenve Prica and the Ezmeast Monay Depasitis mentionad below. The
sl anveloge cordaining EMD amount oe parlicipaiing in Public Auction shall be submfhd 1o b Authon sed Offices of 1SFC, Onor betore 31.03. 2023815
PM at Branch/Comperate Ofice:Office Mo- B-31 0. Deekay Tower, Vikhut! Khnd, Gomtl Nagar Luck now LLP 226010.

'D&gfftﬁr?gffﬂ“ at [-22164, Vasant Kunj, New | ¥ L oan Account] Mame of Borrower(s)/ Co- | Date of Demand Notice | Type of Possession Reserve Earmest

Bl ' o Ma. ! Borrower(s)/ Guarantos(sy [Under Constructival Price Money
Petitioner| | Ap Number | Legal Heirjs)l Legal Rep, | AMoUNt s on date Physical)

r‘”“ff " “E'Ebgng'”““ i the general "”t“': that AP- 1. Namita W/O RajKumar [13104/2021 Under RS. 48,38.850- Rs. 4,83 825 (Four

a"ﬂ'ﬁﬂhcﬂaﬂjg‘f’g Lﬁ?i?:?&g|rﬁ§§3§fnﬁrzmauﬁ diﬂ 0925074/LA1 | 2 RajMumarSingh  |Rs S54B5153- (Fiffy-iour|  Constructive {Farty- Eight lakh |lakh aighty-throe

Saction 13 of e CnﬁaniEE Aok EI].H ;eel-:ing TLALONSO0D akh smchy-five thousand ona thirty-2ight thousand eight

confernation of alteration of e siuason clause TN AN P -3 e o] thousand eight | hundred eighty-five

Il of its memorandum of association in tarms of hundred fifty only) anly)

the special resolution passed at the Extra-
Ordinary General Meating held an Fabruary 28, Luscknaw, UP-297202,

Description of Property: A Thal Piece And Parcel OF Properly Baaring Plat No, 5 & 9, KH Ko 4, Vill- Kamiabad Badal, Mahona, Teh- Bakshi KA Talab,

2023 to enable the Applicant Company far

shifing ils regesterad office fom the "State of If‘m ol
MCT of Delhi” ta the "State of Haryana™, !
fuy parson whosa intarestis likefy o be alfachad 2
by the proposed change of the registared office 1)
of the Applicant Company may deliver elither on
the MCA-21 portal (www.mca.gov.in) by filing 4]
imvestor complaint form or cause fo he
delivered o¢ send by registered post hisiharits

Thea prescritied Terderd Bad Farm and e bems and conditions of sake will e available with the BranchiCorparate Office.Ofice No- B-3M0, Deekay
Tower, Vibhuti Khnd, Gomti Magar L scknow U.P 236010, betwesan 10.00a8.m. to 500 p.m. on anyworking day.

Thee imenceable propeety shall mat be sakd below the Resane Price,

2l tha bids! tenders submitad for the purchase of the above propary's shall be accompanied by Earnes! Money a5 manfioned above. EMD amount
favawring the "India Shalter Finance Conparation Limiled” payable &t Dalhi, Tha EMD amountwill be retum fothe unsuceessiul idders after auctan

Thee beghest bidcer shal b declard a5 successhal bidder provided ahways thal beisha is hegally quakfied b bd and provided lurther thal Be bid amaund is
riat ks tham thea resende prica. tshall ba the diseration of tha Authorised Officer fo decline) accapkance of tha highest bid when the prica offered appaars
imadejuate a5 lo make o nachesable 1o do 50

ohjestions supparted by an affidavit stating the 3] The prospective biddars caninspect tha property on 31.03.2023 batwaen 11.00A Mand 5.00 P.Mwith pricr appomimant.

malure of his'her/its interest and grounds of
oppasition to the REGIOMAL DIRECTOR,
NORTHERM REGION, MINISTRY OF
CORPORATE AFFAIRS, B-2 WiNG, N0 FLOOH,
FARYAVARAMN BHAWAN, CE0 COMPLEE, NEW
DELHI- 110003, wshun 14 (fourtear] days rom B
the data of publicafion of this notice with copies
bo the Applicant Company alils current regisiered )
office addrazs mentigned above and to the
balow mentioned communication address of the
Applicant company 0]
Communication Address:
ZITRON INDEA PVT LTD
CIN: UT4988DL2001PTC114278
Regd. Office: D-212164, Vasant Kunj Mew Delhi- 13
1100740,
E-Mail: adminzitronindia.com 14
For and on behalf of the Applicant Company
ZITRON INDI& PYT LTD

paymantof any duas on ha property.

a5 pf o,

The abave-mantioned BarowerMarlg

Sdl- mierest and supanszes bafoee tha daba of Buclion fading which tha propesty sha
INDRAJIT DHADWAL fram you % ? :
Place: Dalhi Director

Date: 20.03.2023 DIN: 00261141 Date: 20 Mar 23, Flace: Lucknow

1. No.| Description of Lot Reserve Price (in INR) | EMD {in INR)

1. Lot 1: Plant & Machinery at Dausa, 369,774
Rajasthan (Siuated at Lalsot Tunnel].

16,97,748

2, Lot 2: Plant & Machinery at Katra, J&K 12.38,195 3,23.819

— Shirwar]

& Lot 3: Single Plant & Machinery at
Udaipur, Rajasthan {Situated al Lawar
Mines):

Boomer Jumbo Deill,

31,45,533 314,553

OR

[Only in the event where no bid i received for Block A & Block B,
bids received for Block C would be considered.)
Following assets available for sale in e-suction as per Regulation 32(2) of the Insalvency
and Bankrupicy Board of India (Liguidation Procass) Regulations, 2016:

Utkarsh Small Finance Bank
Aapki Unmeed Ka Khaata

1A Scheduled Commercial ﬂ-anlv::l

¢

Registered Offic
Kazi Sarai, Harhua, Varanasi, UP-221 105.

e: Utkarsh Tower, NH - 31 (Airport Road), Sehmalpur,

PUBLIC NOTICE

Gokd Omaments pledgad to the bank at its Allahabad Branch under the fallowing godd
loan accownts which are owerdue and the ornaments were not redeemed by the
borrowers despite our multiphe notices will be auctioned on Friday, 24/03/2023 at the
branch premise of the Utkarsh Small Finance Bank al House no 4728, Grownd Fleor,
Sardar Patel Marg, Civil Lings, PO-Allahabad, District - Allahabad, Uttar Pradesh. Fin
Em:le 211001,

'Sr Loan No. Hame Date Lhnan iir:nss iirélﬁril
Mo. Amouni ({Gms)
1| 135279000  Indu Swarnkar . .
D00R01 G DaD2r2023 ¥, O0400/- 2028
2 [ 135279000 | Sanjay Kumar e ]
000R00? DEAN2022 1 T.101200/- 32.77

Thosa desirous of parficipating inthe auction will have to pay an amount of Rs. 3580/-
as EMD by 23/03/2023. Bank reserves the right to withhold/'cancel/postpone or vary
the terms and condikons of the auctions withoul any reasons thareof.

Sd/-

Date; 20/03/2023 Branch Manager

Place; Allahabad Ltkarsh Small Finance Bank Lid

Smt. Suranti Devi or the
property as mentionad above in
whatsoever manner, shall do so
at one's own risk, cost and
Consequences whersby  my
chent shall nof be responsible
for the same in any manner
whatsoever

Geeta Sharma (Advocate)

Ch. No-30, Western Wing,
Tis Hazari Courts Delhi-110054

damage incurred as a result of
transactions with companies,
associations or individuals
advertising in its newspapers
or Publications. We therefore
recommend that readers
make necessary inquiries
before sending any monies or
entering into any agreements
with advertisers or otherwise
acting on an advertisement in
any manner whatsoever.

PUBLIC NOTICE
Genaral public hereby infarmed
that my Clients Sh. Bani Singh
Slo Late Sohan Lal Rio Vill.
Sikhaida, PilkhuaDehat, Hapur,
Pilkhuwa Post Office, Ultar
Fradesh-243304 has mstituied
a case bearing no. 422023
liled as “Bani Singh Ys. Smi
Pramod" in the Hon'ble Court of
Ms. Preeti Moga, Civil Judge
(Civ. Div)-2, Hapur Courls,
Hapur, U.P. whergin the
ownership rights invohied in
properly bearng no. “Factory
Land & Busding at Khasra No.
440 Min Khat No.00 149 Village
Hawal{Dhaulana Road)
Pargana Dasna tehsil &Disti
Hapur, U.P.{Mear L&T fraining
centre) measuring 6537 Sq
Mtr." are challenged and
whereupan my Client has an
exclusive right'titie/Intarest
being purchaser of the above
said property with his own
funds’earning and whereas the
litle of the above said property
shall be resultant of the final
outcome of the above said suit
[t 5 thersby general public is
informed that any person
dealing with the above said
Smt. Pramod or the property
as mentioned above in
whatsoever manner, shall doso
at ons's own rsk, cost and
conseguences whereby my

THE
USINESS

DAILY.

Utkarsh Small Finance Bank

Aapki Ummeed Ka Khaata
(A Scheduled Commercial Bank)

¢

Lonal Office; Tih Floor, Best Commercial Complex, Near Or Ambedkar Udyan,
Chembur East, Mumbai (MH) — 400071.

Registered Office: Utkarsh Tower, NH - 31 (Airport Road), Sehmalpur,
Kazi Sarai, Harhua, Varanasi, UP-221 105.

PUBLIC NOTICE

zold Ornaments pledged to the bank &t its Panchkuia Branch under the following gold
loan account which is overdue and the ormamants ware not redeamed by the Dorrower
despite our multiple notices will be auctioned on Friday, 24/03/2023 at branch premise
of the Utkarsh Small Finance Bank af S00-6F Secior-10, Panchkula Haryana, Pin
Code-134100

Sr. | Loan No. Name Date Loan  |Gross Weight
No. Amount (Gms)
1 [1508790000 Amit 5o . :

110094,have changed my g-f'ﬁ';g“at‘\é;“%pof}?}z”&g 'Ft,f_lﬁg ISZteéeg 5. | Description of Asset Location | Reserve Price ~ EMD
name to Ravinder Sharma. VIKAS NAGAR, UTTAM NAGAR, Ne. (in INR} | {in INR}
0040659959-4 NEW DELH- 110059 Applicant| |- GroutPump Dausa 816629 | 61,663
[Mukesh K S/0 Manoh Notice is hereby given to the general public| | £ Grout Pump Dausa 351353 | 25135
MU umar,s/0 Manonar  lyat povaMI DIGITAL MARKETING| |1 Gamzen Batching Plant (750 RM) Dausa 762068 | 26,207
Lal,R/0 2/2 Sarojini Nagar SERVICES LLP proposes to make anf [ DG Sa1 160 KVA S 305082 | 30508
Railway Colony Chankya Puri  |application to Registrar of Companies, Delhi , i !
New-Delhi-110021,Have & Haryana under section 13(3) of the Limited| |2 DG Set 125 KVA Dausa 193,221 | 19,322
Changed My Name To Liability Partnership Act, 2008 seeking| | & DG Set62.5KVA Dausa 13350 | 13353
Mukesh Kumar permission Yo change s Registered officel 7 | DG Set 15KVA Dausa 1.01,370 | 10,137
Arora,Permanently. Delhi fo the. "Stato of Urtar Pradest. | | & | EleckicWelding Machines Dausa 19,889 | 1989
0040659959-6  |Any person whose interest is likely to be| | % Arc Welding Machines Dausa M7w| 2173
affected by the proposed change of the| [T Excavator EX-110 Dausa 5,22,632 | 52263
registered office of the LLP may deliver either| -
on MCA-21 Portal on (www.mca.gov.in) by| L1 Jack Hammes Dausa 28220 | 2822
filling investor complaint form or cause to be| | T2 Yibrator Motor Dausa 22460 | 2246
cbiocions suppored b an et siaing | o] AU J2CK Eols B3| 3%
jections su y an affidavit stati = -

PUEBLIC NOTICE hisiher interest and grounds of oppositions to| |4 Indica (DL 1C5 2549} Dausa B3.485 | 6349
Genaral pubdic hareby informed the Registrar of Companies, Delhi & Haryana| | 15 | Bolero Camper (RJ 27 GC 0584} Dausa 105,307 | 10,54
Uhiar my Cariks Sih. e noh at 4th Floor, IFCI Tower, 61, Nefru Place, New| [ 46 | TataAulomohile Crane (TL360Z) | Dausa 305,676 | 30,568
a0 Late Sohan Lal Rio Vil Delhi-110019 within Twenty One days (21)| = Desiion S T Y 63
Sikhaida, Pilkhualehat, Hapur, from the date of publications of this notice with| | sl it il o '

Pilkhuwa Post Office, Uttar a copy to the petitioner LLP at its Registered| | 18 Printers Dausa 1,233 123
Pradesh-243304 has instituted gfggl:eglt-(t)h&?((j;drgaiggrat%ngdv?ﬁlAOVSV - 19 Air Cooler Dausa 16743 | 1674
3.chae Iearg 1o HEDE? NAGAR, UTTAM NAGAR, 20 DG Set 62 5KVA Dawsa 134,086 | 13407
titled as “Bani Singh Vs. Smi. NEW DELHI- 110050

Suranti in the Hon'ble Court of For & On Behalf of the POVAMI DIGITAL| |- (L80) Hi AR o)
;-E. PIE?'EI; ;ﬂﬂgﬁ CNFEJL'-ﬂQE MARKETING SERVICES LLP| | ZZ Jack Hammer Dausa 39428 | 3943

iv. Div)-2, Hapur Courts, Sdl- = =
Hapur, U.PF. wherein the Date : 20.03.2023 PRABHAKAR KUMAR & SHF Motor Cowsa_ | 30,356 %006
wne{&hlp rlgh15 Invmred In Place New De|h| (DeS|gnat.ed Partner) E’d 5 HP rdmnr DELI'."jEl | 1?.335 1.:"3'3
property bearing no. “Khasra DPIN : 08650995 '35 T'\Wagon-R [DLOCAL4941) Davsa | 141560 | 14,158
bl il e, YRage Sklier 26| AirCompressor XAT 266 Kalra 304877 | 30,468
Pargana Dasna tehsil & Distt. 37 DG Sel IR0 KA ol 51853 | 21965
Hapur, Ghaziabad. U.P. - il 2 :
measuring 2530 5q. Mu® are "IMPORTANT" 2R Putzmeister Shorcrote 1404 E Jammiu LEor 282 | &R TR
g‘l-_a"ewﬁ*ﬂ and W“Ereuﬁrﬂ:-n my 75 | Putzmeister Pump SPM 4210 Wetkrel | Jammu 807,347 | 60,735

ient has an exclusive : : : :
purchaser of the above said acceptance Of advertISIng 3 Ventilation Fan Jammi 84,809 £.881
property with his own coov. itis not possible to verify 32 DG Setez 5 KVA Jammu 135846 | 13535
xecleaiming oric niens e copY: P The  Indi 33| SteslEmply ContamenPortable Cabin | Jammu 31,750 | 3176
SR S R Its contents. The Indian || 3™ \elding Transfomer Jammu 27726 | 2773
autcome of the above said suit Express (P) Limited cannot be 15 Step Up Transformer Jammu L ETTY
It is thereby general public is held responsible for such || [3& | Voho-140 Entractor Jammu B,38.375 | 83838
informed _thal any person f | 37 | AirCompressor Jammu 100720 | 10,072
dealing with the above said contents, nor tor any loss or : P 2

| Those dasirous of participating in the awction will have to pay an amount of Rs. 5000/~

as EMD by 23/03/2023. Bank reserves the right to withhold/cancel postpone or vary
the tarms and conditions of the auctions without any reasons theraof.

&=
Branch Manager
tkarsh Small Firance Bank Lid,

Date: 2070372023
Place; Panchkula

Interastad applicants may rafer 1o the complete E-Auction Process Information Documeant
containing detads with respect o the e-auckon Bid AppScation Form, Declaration and
Underiakings, Other Forms, Terms & Conditions with respect to the sale of assets. The
detailed documents as required to paricipate in the e-auction along with all the applicable
ferms and conditions can be obtained by the prospective bidders by writing an emaif af
ulrn liguedator@grmail.com or by contacting Mr. Rajat Garg at +91-B010802727 or Mr
Pallav Kulshrestha +81-8359349321. The Liquidator resarve the nght to accapt or reject
or cancel any bid or extend or modsfy any terms of the E-Auction at any time withoui
assigning any reason, The intending bidders, prior to submitting their bid, should make
their indepandant inquiries during the site visit regarding the title of the assets, and
mainienance charges, if any, and inspect the assets ai their own expense and satisfy
themsshes,

It is heraby informad to all interastad parties that in case any successful bid is achiewvad for
Block A thereby announcing a successful bidder, the remaining block ie. Block B and
Block C shall autormabcally stand canceled. Further, in case any successful bid is
achieved for any Lot of Black B thereby announcing a successiul bidder of any particular
Lot, the assets of that Lot shall not form part of the auction for Block C. Further, in cazse any
suceessful bid is achieved for all the Lots of Block B thereby announcing a successtul
bidder for each Lo, the e-aection for Block C shall avtormatically stand cancelad.

For details kindly refer e-auction process information document. S

Kanti Mohan Rustagi

Liguidator

In the matter of UTM Engineering Private Limited
Req. No. IBBIIPA-D02/IP-N00097/2017-1810240

VERY IMPORTANT

Office. Address: Address for Correspondence:
F-14,1st Floor, Kailash Cofony, Cilo Resurgent Resolution Professionals LLP
Mew Delhi 110045, 205, 09th Floor, TOWER-C,
Reg, Email Id: Unitech Business Zone, The Close South,
kanfi.rustagi@patanjaliassociates.com Sector 50, Gurugram, Haryana-122018.
Date: 20032023 Contact Number: +91-B01068027 27
Place: New Delhi Email Id (Procass specific): utm Bguidatari@gmail.com

DAILY

BAAARELLY

-
-

e F -.rnl 3

chient shall not be respansible
for the same in any manners
whatsoever.
Geeta Sharma (Advocate)
iCh. No-30, Wastern Wing,
Tis Hazari Courts,Delhi-1100
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The person declared 25 a successful bidder shall, immediztely after the declaration, deposit 25% of the ameount of purchase maney! highest
bid which would include EMD amouwni to the Authorised Officer within 24 Hrs. and in defaull of such deposit, the property shall forthwith be
put bo fresh auction! sabe by private trealy,
71 In case tha initial deposit is made as abowve, the balance amount of the purchaser money payable shall be
Autharsed Officer on or before the 155k day from the date of conflrmation of the sale of the propenty, exclusive of such day or If the 15th day be
a Sunday or other hodiday, then an the first office day after the 15th day.
In the event of dafault of any payment within the pericd mantionad aboee, the propanty shall be put to fresh auction! sale by privete freaty. The daposi
Incluaching EMD shall slaed Sorfeited by Inche Sheller Finance Comporation L. and e detadling purchases shall kse all GEims 50 We groperty,
Tha abowva sale shall be subjacl to @he final approval of I5FC, interestad paries are requestad o warifylconfirm the statutory and ofher duas Be
SalesProperty fax, Elecricity dues, and socety dues, from the respective departments faffices. The Campany does not undertake ary responsibilgy of

id by the purchasar to the

TOS of 1%, if any, shall b2 payabls I:q. tha highest bidder aver the highe st declared bid smount. The payment needs to b depositad by the highest biddar
I Tha PN o thie GO ey and i copy of e chiaflan 5 D subenitled bo he CLEisny

11} Salais striclly subect bo tha barms and candifions incorporabed in Lhis advedisement and inle the prescribed lendes farm

12] The successhd uinu:ler.'pu.rchaser shall baar all stamp duly, reqestrasion fees, and incidental expansas for getting sale cemficats regisiered as applicable

The Authorisad Oficer has the abscluta right bo scceptar rajact the bid ar edjourn! postpone f cancel the lender without assigning any reasan thereaf and
aisa to madify any flemns and condians of
Inleresiod biddars may corfacl Mr. Aamil Bumar Jaiswal al Mab., Mo, 5752777751 dunng affice boues ¢ 10,0080 168,00 PS8,
15 DAYS SALE NOTICE TO THE BORROWER/GUARANTOR/MORTGAGOR
criguaraniors ana haraby noficad o p?t the sum as manlionad in Damand Malice under section 132 with as on date

ks sale withaust army prior notices,

e wuclianed and balanca dusas, ¥ any, will be recoversd wilh inkaras] and coest

Mr. Amit Kumar Jaiswal
Makb- ST9ZTTTTI1

[(AUTHORIZED OFFICER)
INCHA SHELTER FINANCE CORPORATION LTD

UNIMONI FINANCIAL SERVICES LIMITED

RO: N.G. 12 & 13 Ground Floor, North Block, Manipal Centre, Dickensan Road,
Bangalore - 560 042. CIN No.UB5110KA1935PLCO18175

PUBLIC NOTICE

This is to inform the Public that Auction of pledged Gold Omaments will be
conducted by UNIMONI FINANCIAL SERVICES LIMITED on 22.03.2023 at
10:00 am at NO:1, GROUND FLOOR, F1 SHOPPING COMPLEX,F1 HOSPITAL
BUILDING, 37, LUCKNOW - 226001. The Gold Omaments to be auctioned
belong to Loan Accounts of our various Customers who have failed to pay their
dues. Our notices of auction have been duly issued to these borrowers. The
Gold Omaments to be auctioned belong to Overdue Loan Accounts of our
various Customers mentioned below with branch name.

Loan Mos.: BASTI (BTI}- 1975743, DEORIA (DED) - 1940792, 1940828.
GORAKHPUR (GOR)-1939278, 1971117, 1976933. KASIA (KSA)- 1971438
1992551, 1935536, 1974931, 1987712, 1967033, 19401 72, 1974187, 1941015,
1971126, 1972121. UNNAD (UNN)- 1935121, 1956643, 1959535, 1958200,
1941592, 1967088, 1947652, 1958481, 1975557, 1977216

For more details, please contact : Mr. NITISH KUMAR - 9935383311

ihe |'I,II { to alter fhe

'
L4 l'|.1""|III I I.|| Focounis o be

.':i|lr_ll_|| 12/ cancel he auction withouwl ar 1y e o nofice _I

UNIMONI FINANCIAL SERVICES LIMITED
RO: N.G. 12 & 13 Ground Floor, Norih Block, Manipal Centre, Dickenson Road,
Bangalore - 560 042, CIN Mo UB5110KA1995PLLCOTE1TS

PUBLIC NOTICE

This is to inform the Public that Auction of pledged Gold Omaments will be
conducted by UNIMONI FINANCIAL SERVICES LIMITED on 22.03.2023 at
10:00 am at NO. BRG2-2780/1/27811 4 FIRST FLOOR, CHOPRA BUILDING,
GTROAD, JALANDHAR - 144001. The Gold Ormaments to be auctioned belong
to Loan Accounts of our various Customers wha have failed to pay their dues.
Our notices of auction have been duly issued to these borrowers. The Gold
Ornaments to be auctioned belong to Overdue Loan Accounts of our various
Customers mentioned below with branch name.

Loan Mo. DASUYA (DAS)- 1991748, 1973139, 1971486, 1973573.
GURDASPUR (GUU)- 1955833, 1974736. HOSHIARPUR (HO3)- 1934912,
1921314, 1977229, 1937915, 1973339, 1972978. JALLANDHAR (JAL)-
1940695, 1965301. MAHILPUR(MHP) -1922275, 1919805. NAKODAR
(NAK) - 1975604, 1975617, 1982980. PATHANKOT (PKT)- 1933182,
1975927. PATIALA (PTA)- 1972206, 1940796. PHAGWARA (PHA)-
1940077. PHILLAUR(PHI) -1919008, 1938055, 1986476, 1978165,
1972112, TANDA (TAD)- 1971322, 1975356. BALACHAUR (BAL)- 1939224,
1974061. BATALA(BTA) - 1935458, 1938909. BATHINDA(BAT)- 1955494.
CHANDIGARH (CHA)- 1979631, 1926475, 1940404. GARHSHANKAR
(GAR)-2011566, 1933924, 1970959. JAGRAON (JAA)-1972399, 1970168,
1920502, 1953823, 1936283, 1973579, 1962752, 1972826. KAPURTHALA
(KAP)-1921558, 1971127, 1971129, 1973926, 1940103, 2009234,
1940735. LUDHIANA (LUD)- 1955548. MOGA (MODG) - 1972631, 1936151.
NAWANSHAHR (NAW) -1958706

For more details, please contact : Mr. K. Arbinder Singh - 9313889202
(Reserves the right to alter the number of accounts to be

auctioned &' postpone / cancel the auciion without any prior nofice,

SYSCHEM (INDIA) LIMITED

Regd. Office : Village Bargodam, Tehsil Kalka, Distt. Panchkula [Haryana]

Website : www.syschem.in CIN:

L24219HR1993PLCO32195

the General Circular June

voting (‘remote E-voling)

by email to beetalia@gmail comor to infof@syschem.in.

Aadhar Card) and ECS Mandate to your Depository Participant.

Manner of casting vote{s) through e-voting is given below:

used for e-voling through Postal Ballot.

casfing vole through e-vofing

Place: Chandigarh
Date: 20-03-2023

PUBLIC NOTICE OF POSTAL BALLOT E-VOTING

Notice is hereby given pursuant to pursuant to the provisions of section 110 and other applicable provisions of the Companies Act, 2013
(the "Act’), read together with section 20 and 22 of the Companies
Rules”), the Companies (Appointiment and Qualifications) Rules of the Companies Act, 2013 including any Statutory modifications or re-
enaciment thereof for the time being in force any other applicable provisions of the Act and the rule made there under, read with the General
circular No. 2272020 dated Apni 8, 2020, the General Circular 17/2020 dated 13 Apni, 2020 the general Circular 222020 dated June 2020,
15, 2020, the General Circular 33/2020 dated 28 September, 2020, the General Circular 39/2020 dated 31
December, 2020, General Circular No 10/2020 dated 23 June, 2021
Circulars, if any ("MCA Circulars™), pursuant to Regulation 44 of Security and Exchange Board of India (Listing Obligations and Disclosure
Requirement) Regulation 2015 ("SEBI LODR Regulations™) Secrelarial Standard on General Meeting (“55-2") issued by the Institute of
Companies EECFE!HF}' of India and pursuant (o all other applicable laws and regulabions, 1o he shareholders or members{"members”) of
Syschem India Limited ("SIL") (" THE Company”) for seeking approval for the resolutions appended below through Postal Ballot/ electronic

(Managemeant and Administration) rules, 2014 (the “Management

the general Circular 20/21 dated December8, 2021 and other

In compliance with the relevant circulars, the documents for inspection will be available whose email addrasses are registered with the
Company [ Depository Participant(s). The aloresaid documents will also be available on the Company’s websile al www.syschem.in and
on the website of BSE Limited at www bseindia.comand on the website of CDSL at www.evotingindia.com

Manner of registering / updating email addresses by the Members is given below:

» In case Equity Shares are held in physical mode please provide Folio No., Name of shareholder, scanned copy of the Share Certificate
(front and back), PAN (self-attesied scanned copy of PAN card), AADHAR (self-attested scanned copy of Aadhar Card) and ECS Mandate

* Incase shares are heid in demat mode, pleasa provide DPID-CLID (16 digit DPID + CLID or 16 digit Beneficiary |0), Name, Client Master
or copy of Consolidated Account statement, PAN (self-attested scanned copy of PAN card), AADHAR (self-attested scanned copy of

* Members will have an opportunity to cast their vote(s) on the business as set out in the Notice of the Postal Ballot through remote e-
votfing facifity (‘remote e-voling’). The faciiity for e-voting will also be made available duning the E-voting to those mambers who
could not cast their vole(s) by remole e-voting. The delailed procedure for e- will be provided in the Notice of the Postal Ballot.
« Members who do nol receive email or whose email address is nol registered with the Company /
may generate login credentials by following instructions grven in the Notice of Postal Ballot. The same login credentials can also be

Depository Participant(s),

« Mambers are requested o carefully read all the Notes set out in the Notice of the Postal Ballot and in particular, instructions for

By order of the Board
For Syschem (India) Limited

Sdl/-
{Ranjan Jain)
Managing Director

New Delhi
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SALE NOTICE
M/s UTM ENGINEERING PRIVATE LIMITED (IN LIGUIDATION)
CIN: IH4107DL204PTC2T0321
Gali no. 2, Block B Ugrasen Park,

Registerad Office: Plot No. 26127128,
Wangloi Road, Najafgarh, Delhi - 110043

E-AUCTION SALE NOTICE

UNDER INSOLVENCY AND BANKRUPTCY CODE, 2016
Motice is heraby given to the public in general under the Insolvency and Bankruptey Code,
2016 and the regulations made thereunder thal the assets of Mis UTM Engineering
Private Limited (in Liquidation) (*Corporate Debtor”) are being proposed o be soid on
standalone basis/collectively lon parcel basis as per Requiation 32 (a) or Requiation 32(c)
of Regulation 32{d) of the Insolvency and Bankrupicy Board of India (Liquidation Process)
Requlations, 2016, on “AS ISWHERE IS™, "AS IS WHAT 15", "WHATEVER THERE IS”
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CHN: D014
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e 20032023

5/ || AND “WITHOUT RECOURSE BASIS” through e-auction platform. The said propesition
Revyfas: 20 5 2023 PR bkl for disposition is without any kind of warranties and indemnities.
zeqeer: v Py Srfamitr psgsonas | | The bidding of the assets stated in the below table shall take place through the online e-
auction service provider, M's e-Procurement Technologies Limited - Auction Tiger via the
websile https:/incltauction.auctiontiger.net
“whi Wo. sl Submission of Requisile Forms, | From 20032023 to 03.04.2023
(W (Frre) P, 2014 @ Affidavits, Declaration etc.
P 30 % sryam) Filewsit! Inspection Dale From 0704 2023 k0 13,04 2023
Wl & Jola wrfes w oF e 4 g | aet Date for Subméssion of EMD 17.04.2023 by 05.00 PM.
= A oftda w9 # oy wwam w3 | :
G h T R Date and Time of Auction BLOCK A
Date: 19.04.2023, Tima: 11:00AM ta 01:00 PM
ﬂ'm"“'g o {With an unlimited extension of 5 Mins)

BLOCKB

Crata: 2004 2023, Time: 11:00AM to 01:00 P
(Withan wnlimited extension of S Mins)
BLOCKC

Date: 21,04 2023, Time: 11:00AM to 01:00 PM
('With an unlimited extension of 5 Mins)

BLOCK A

Following block of assels available for sale in e-auction as per Regulaton 32(c) of the
Insolvency and Bankrupicy Board of India (Liguidation Procass) Regulations, 2016

51. No| Description of Block Reserve Price (in INR) | EMD (in INR)
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1 Plant & Machinery at Dausa, Rajasthan 1,00,81.478 10,068,147
[Situated at Lalsot Tunnal), Katra, J&K
[3 K= from Katra towards Reasi Road
- Shirwar} and Udaipur, Hajasthan
[Siuated at Zavwear Minas),

. e M fei e Hehel HN

. . T (Shgg)

1.1 1508790000 T g | 03—10—2022] <. 21500/ — 07.24
006003 w8

OR
[BLOCK B
{Only in the event where no bid is received for Block A,
bids received for Block B would be considered.)
Following biock of assets avalable for sake in e-auction as per Regulation 32(d) of the
Insolvency and Bankrupicy Board of India (Liquidation Process) Regulations, 2016:

A | UM SR 8 sog® Aldadl bl [aid 23—03—2023 T ORIl & w4 H
¥. 5000,/ — 1 Qb T BT A PIAT 81| 96 & 9 97 {50 SROT & AR o
A+ / R /=affrq &t srerar Al & fHt v ordt @ age B e R 2 |
Bl /—
IMET Udefeh

falaN

ShY Wl Bred do fofics

fedi® : 20—03—2023
R gAdEl

5l. No.| Description of Lot Reserve Price (in INR) | EMD (in INR)
1. Lot 1: Plant & Machinery at Dausa, 36,957,748 369,774
Rajasthan {Sduated al Lalsot Tunnel)
2 Lot 2: Piant & Machinery at Katra, J&K 32 38,195 1,23.819
{3 Kms from Kabra towards Reas Road
— Shirwar)
Fi Lot 3: Single Plant & Machinery at 31,45 533 3,14.553
Udaipur, Rajasthan (Situated at Zawar
Mines):
Boomer Jumbo Drill,

OR

(Only in the event where no bid is received for Block A & Block B,
bids received for Block C would be considered.)
Following assets available for sale in e<auction as per Requlation 32{a) of the Insolvency
and Bankruptcy Board of India (Liquidation Process) Regulations, 2016:
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“"IMPORTANT"™

Whilst care is taken prior to
acceptance of advertising
copy, it is not possible to verify
its contents. The Indian
Express (P) Limited cannot be
held responsible for such
contents, nor for any loss or
damage incurred as a result of
transactions with companies,
associations or individuals
advertising in its nevvspapers
or Publications. We therefore
recommend that readers
make necessary inquiries
before sending any monies or
entering into any agreements
with advertisers or otherwise
acting on an advertisement in
any manner whatsoever.
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Interested applicants may refer to the complets E-Auciion Process Information Document
containing details with respect to the e-auction Bid Application Form, Declaration and
Undertakings, Other Forms, Terms & Conditions with respect to the sale of assats. The
detailed documents as required to participate in the e-awckion along with all the applicable
terms and conditions can be ablained by the prospective bidders by writing an emad at
utm.iquidator@@gmail.com or by contacting Mr. Rajat Garg at +91-8010602727 or Mr.
Pallav Bulshrestha +91-3893340321. The Liquidator reserve the night to accept or reject
of cance! any bid or extend or modify any lerms of the E-Auction at any time without
assigning any reason. The intending bidders, prior to submitting their bid, should make
their independent inquiries during the site visit regarding the tile of the assets, and
maintenance charges, if any, and inspect the assels al their own expense and salisfy
thamsahmes.

Itis hereby informed to allinterested parties that i case amy successiul bid is achieved for
Block A thersty announcing a successiul bidder, the remaining block e, Block B and
Block C shall autornatically stand canceled. Further, in case any successful bid is
achieved for any Lot of Block B thereby announcing a successiul bidder of any parlicular
Lot, the assets of that Lot shall not form part of the auction for Block C. Further, in case any
successhul bid is achieved for all the Lots of Block B thereby announcing a successiul
bidder for each Lod, the e-auction for Block C shall automatically stand canceled.

Fordetails kindly refer e-avction process information document., Sdi-

Kanti Mohan Rustagi

Liguidator

In the matter of UTM Engineering Private Limited
Req. No, |BEINPA-D02/IP-NO00ST/201 7-18/1 (240

VERY IMPORTANT

Office. Address:

F-14,1st Floor, Kalash Colony,

Wew Dalhi 110048,

Reg. Email Id:

kanii rustapi@patanjaiassociates.com

Date: 20.03.2023
Place; New Delhi

Address for Correspondence:

Clo Resurgent Resolution Professionals LLP
905, 09th Floor, TOWER-C,

Linitech Business Zone, The Close Sauth,
Sector 50, Gurugram, Hanyana-122013.
Confaci Number: +#91-8010802727

Email Id (Process specifich: utm liquidator@gmail com

8l Description of Asset Location | Reserve Price EMD
No. {in INR) | {in INR) . ﬁ'
1 Growt Pumg Dausa B 16,629 | 81,883 <l EI;' _gT- Cl 1"
2 Grout Pumgp Dausa 351,353 | 35135 Hhell, U9 UH UH U
3 Gamzen Batching Plant (750 RM) Drausa 252,068 | 26207
4 DG Set 160 KVA Dausa 305,082 | 30,508 , ,
5 | DG Sel125KVA Dausa 193,221 | 19,322 feien : 21 Wl 2023, WTCTEAR
[ DG Sete2 5 VA Dausa 13350 | 13353 HHT: A7 3.00 a@r
T DG Set 15 KVA Dausa 1,001,370 [ 10,137 3
& | Electic Welding Machines Davsa 19,880 | 1,089 SEUCIR GO
9 Arc Welding Machines Dausa 21 728 2173 Those wishing to have their names added to the email list may please email
10 Excavator EX-110 Dau=a 022632 | 52263 us at:-
Lk Jack Harmnmer Dausa 28220 | 2822 ces2nmml@gmail.com
12 Vibrator Mator Dausa 22460 | 2,246 Occasional Papers:
13 Hydraulic Jack Dausa 30,364 3,036 P o o
1 indica (DL 1 CS 2549) Dausa B3 435 F 340 http://nehrumemorial.nic.in/publication
15 Bolero Camper (RJ 27 GC 0584) Dausa 1,056,307 | 10,331 Video Links of Lectures:
16 Tata Autamohile Crane (TL 360 Z) Dausa 305,676 | 30,568 https://www.youtube.com/user/nehrumemoriallibrary
17 Desktop Systems Dausa 3617 62
18 Prinkers Donrsa 1933 173 CBC 09142/12/0061/2223
19 Hir Cooler Dau=a 16,743 1,674 : .
20 | DGSetfi2 SKVA Dausa 1,34,066 | 13,407 9530
21| Oven(Lab) Dausa 0,400 | 3,040 SIEE IR %
22 Jack Harmmer Drausa 0428 | 3943 [wreeita faren @9 wims sgm a8 (@wie =i & fore s vin
= = HF Motor — 0356 | 309 STEFAT AT wihm) faf e 2016 & faf s 6 & andi)
24 5HP Motor Dausa 17,335 1,733 =t =TT !ﬂq'ﬁl o S— = 2 b al
I 4 o q — o g R S .

L o e

: - = HES0 L bt e 2 | FME dARm S e a2z R, 2011
Z DG Set 180 KVA el 219853 | 2195 | BB oo Fos s e wharenT At s, e
26 Pufzmeister Shorcrete 1404 E Jammu boT.282 | 55,728 ST frfee A oefpa &
2 Putzmeister Pump SPM 4210 Wetkret | Jammu B07,347 | 80735 | Bl [ wmifie SR @ smve qea | US2 ROODL2011PLC225377
30 | MaiGrouting Pump Jamrnu 89386 | E£539 NI/ AT SN A e W | S i
T Veniation Fan g 5 A0 | BEET . | SIS AaT & Tadd Frierd aul (S S, ATgeive u—0e, e 20w, 547 i,
: o = O | s e (ol ) e sio4 yeEd), dreg, Re, aud
12 | DGSelB25KVA Jammu 135846 | 13585 | B et B e
k%] Steel Empty Container/Portable Cabin | Jammu H7H | 3176 | M. | mfE SRS wan w17 AT, 2023
K" Welding Transfomar Jammu I 2773 AT ST ety
a5 Step UF-Trgngfﬂ.r'rﬂgr Jamrmiu 36 414 3,641 | DI | 0w stersen WA s | 13 Raorae 2023 (e s 1 B
36 Yolve-140 Enfractor Jammu Ba8a75 | a3aze| o AT &l qatpnin T AT 9 4 soai fa)

: b | s A AT Aa B weH | BT T

T A 1,00 10,07 ;
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e, ik e o g
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AT S T, Oen AT g —Ha

£3—1T0, & LGN -lgl':éll-l'-ﬂ E-.ii-':!*l;_l:". $ LA N
HETE — 131001 W : harishtaneja7BEgmail com

302, TA 28 T, AT T o, SR
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&t rtae g T faferd s i Sy waTe = e sy afirm sy weam antar fm d
& 1 oft e e T Pt ® o semmt o sl wemEm wdes w g e e a
81 WTEl 2023 T TS W HATOT E I A S A R 14 o W S i T
RTHIET=T SR eIt T S =t 0 =it =it & |

e et v Feed o aifr sfem (wine wftet & o T wfte) B 200e &
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BT =T W (o o e f "R AT, TRTH T e R, R S 4 s, TR
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gea & o 2 7 B aiaei # s
ATaFas 2002 (2002 &1 54) F AT A9 HEYE A (v@d) FoEEs, 2002 &
Fraae 2 s aRa g 13(12) s o o S s gu S5 A TG = $
oHE AE avie B S 5 gue i 7 A i wEeEl $1 39 gEAT & Wi $1
T afeta wfer ams & & FEs Ba an o =m aiE
; e wen 2 6
4 79 FawEs & Faw 9 & |5y 9iEa @i
gl %1 991 39 g0 AHEEsd A 92 " ahfE
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FHAET B S AR

13 #m{u}imﬂﬁﬂﬂﬁ!mﬁum

wframfeet w5t gard

T &)

I\ 7T A9 I/ W A # o AW d% oftE SR & =9 # sl g e A o
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1.] 4 SSd $HR 9 9] T, ot T=-56, Heg Uekid, Ma- omgy|17.11.2022{16.03.2023 3.
TH-56, Ueg Ui, Ta-sclich, IMS| SIEHT, MiSrAmae, S geu § o 16,82,613.58/-
TR, M, 3.9.-201002 | ST ST ST Tt oG YehTST o AT (e
M & oA Wolld FAR WG A9 W G 1 1 THE 9W, A 17.11.2022 TH
A1 IEHS TRAS, -1, AE US| &R 63.75 o T (53.30 o qAu 3R
fosa R, mivrmene, $.9.- 201009 HieY) (F€ FeR 1, fSieg Fa) 2026, TR AT
3R ol HeR 222 | 231, TEES W& e ) qen
Al AA FAR G 9 YehI9, TI-56,| 3364, f&ATe 18.07.2008 T q&d el 17.11.2022 &
TR Toid, Ud-saieh, IS R =R V, MEeT & e § S Td 3
TMSTATETE, 3.9.-201002 | W91 &F: TWR| USiihd) HHM: I wiie FX 18 TR
fm faumn, Sl g, misEEe) S |fd| | 18 Wie @eT ge:
3.9.-201002 3T St Tt arell Ui Afdq o9 18 T dier uiEy: wi
I Y, fErd : TE-56, Wag HeR 57
Treld, Ud-salish, I TR
TMiSTTETe, F4i-201002 |

2.| Teler: Sudt I A T AN T S TSTHER R|04,03.2020017.03.2023| ¥ 6,50,863/-
el off T FEUR AN SR A S| T R gt h qEE W, R e (fores
FHR AN G Al GRS el 680, HehM HeR 61 (JUAT), TTM] 04.03.2020 T
T e 7R TR 61, TEe TR A, FerE, M, 39 9es A 3R
[T, MSEATETE Jdi-201001 Rerq, |9 52.50 & TS, GHEMW: TR AT
3R MR TN A wr wfHe &) qer
it forsiel oal =t 3 Tl BRI: Hord ST R0 ERT: 15 i 04.03.2020 &
i, frardt 7er o) 537, FON TR, 1 SeARTT IRH gRI: A =S T 3
WS e, MiAER, 3.9.-201003 A TR

3.| wofer: Tl W -37 (WA FeR 671/2) | 1T1.2022{17.03.2023| ®. 33,85,264.4]
Al R $AR IH W siEl @E R, Tel TR 2, (o
oA SR R A gouo TS, e, et ~53 1 T 17.11.2022
Al o Rz FER o, e gew e A s FAN T R
T et qeR Hee <it-2/261 T o) st s FER £t =g T H ECIRIERIS]
ferer, feeeft goRT wal « W-37 ([AY 9 W, 719 930 o Fe, Hm: 3 A &) Fel
TR 671/2), W FHE, R TR} gRE: Gk 15 e =Sl gd 5RT: 3 17.11.2022 9
T FeR 2, TG, WMo, feewlt | %y dufy <for gRn: wew 15 W RERCED]

el ufsw gR: 31 Wi Ul TR

4.| sier: i wen $-70 1 wawa un, wre|0L01.2020]17.03.2023) %. 49,09,156.41
it Rrarie TMad I et foher TaH | 41.80 Tfer & At wife FoR 38 (fores
femedl wep HeR 139, Wil {13 ¥ fafifa, wER FeR 550, g @l 02.01.2020 H
AR TR TRIETH WMeadl, feeedl-32] et Far 1, ¥ex @i weren e e 3R
A E A WAl el FeA 270 e W, et ~93 i e T S
e WA 38, Tell e 1, =R Wk F i feherqy # fora s wi wmfher §) aon
Tt e, fovawdl AR & W) g o9 fEor ¥ aRer ¥ 9 02.01.2020 ¥
Meey, feeet-93 iR Hadt umelt Taw T fraws = T T
Aot Sremelt Han am % 9| W) JIR
ECIRNCIE G| i
framft HeRm FeR 139, el FoR 13| 3o el 10 Wie, qd: wite W@ 39
SeTSR TR THRAS ey, foeeli-32] afior: goit @t wofy, ofvem: wite
WY & gEA qar g WE& $-70) Hew 36 3iR 37
e JeR 38, el e} 1, e «h,
T s, oot

5.| SureR: & wfeier fife g ot o e 17112022} 17.03.2023 %,
gt wnfer<x f9g g7 ook fig, Feal] am w fice—3 smearda Wi e 16,55,501.59/-
toS-127, WA A, feeed| 11, gEd A oa % siieR R, (et
110095, |11 B: Hie HeX A-118/11) S AEs, e emE.sh, Suft, wmehar] 17.11.2022 TH
T A, AR MET F M| ey 3 mivrarare, S gy i feord EEERIEIN
gdier, METEE, 3.9.- 201005 3N wife He) §-118 TR Ffa TR TR S
T g o sy fiE dRgeR Tl T | AT 41.80 o HeX G| et &) el
WSS, Wil R 836, 94 R 13| ufan| (q&dsh 39 dotareh gatd o) 17.11.2022
IMEATHR TMET THRETH 1, MG . 1, fieg . 10851, I8 TEA 35 9 RIERCIR]
3.9.-201005, 3R TR & AR 104 wHiE 957 ReAiF 04.02.2015 TR
FAR A IF FU A T F |) Fre:
AGY A 9 U oAl @i G 3w wife 9w 117-9 SR i
836, Ak R 6 (IWHS) WCAUR Far 119-3 Id: I 80 W =rer
M THRIYH -1, Tioramee | giym: afda o
201005, 1Y &l: T-1/300, SITATH
feoeme TeEyE -2, Wi,
TSTATEE-201005
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